ORDINANCE #07-08

AN ORDINANCE OF THE MAYOR AND COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF
‘SURPRISE, ARIZONA, AMENDING CHAPTER 15.04 OF THE
SURPRISE MUNICIPAL CODE, AND IN ORDER TO ADOPT THE
INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE 2006, INTERNATIONAL FIRE
CODE 2006, INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE 2006,
INTERNATIONAL MECHANICAL CODE 2006, INTERNATIONAL
PLUMBING CODE 2006, INTERNATIONAL FUEL GAS CODE 20086,
INTERNATIONAL ELECTRIC CODE 2006, INTERNATIONAL ENERGY
| CONSERVATION CODE 2006, INTERNATIONAL EXISTING
BUILDINGS CODE 2006, INTERNATIONAL PROPERTY
MAINTENANCE CODE 2006, AND THE AMENDMENTS USED TO
REGULATE CONSTRUCTION WITH!N THE CITY.' '

WHEREAS, the Mayor and Council deem it necessary, in order to protect the
public health, safety and welfare and public and private property, to adopt certain rules
and regulations controlling the design, construction, quality of materials, erection,
instaliation, alteration, repair, location, relocation, replacement, addition to, use and
maintenance of heating, cooling, ventilating, process piping, refrigerator systems,
incinerator or other heat-producing appliance and to adopt certain rules and regulations
to regulate the erection, construction, enlargement, alteration, repair, moving, removal,
and demolition, conversion, cccupancy, equipment, use, height, area and mamtenance
of all buildings, structures, or prem:ses and;

WHEREAS in 2004 the Mayor and City Councn! adopted the 2003 set of
lntemational Codes, and:

WHEREAS the 2006 set of lntematlonal Codes is meant to replace the 2003
series prewously adopted by the Mayor and Clty Council, and,;

. WHEREAS City staff has reviewed these International Codes and has

recommended the followrng amendments and;

WHEREAS this family of codes has been supported by organizations such as -

_the Arizona Building Officials, Inc., National Association of Homebuﬂders FEMA and
the American Institute of Architects and;

WHEREAS, the codes and amendments being adopted herein were made pubhc
records by Resolutlon # 07-39, and;

WHEREAS, the city desires to amend the Clty Code by deleting the amendment
language from the Code and providing those lnternatlonal Code amendments as
separate documents, and;

Ordinance #07-08 1
June 7, 2007




WHEREAS Arizona Rev:sed Statute §9-802 allows a mummpahly to enact the
provisions of a code or public record by reference without having to publish the entire
code or public record. :

NOW, THEREFORE BE IT ORDAINED by the Mayor and City Councﬂ of the
City of Surprise that

_ Sectlon 1. The followmg codes and append:ces as pubiished by the Internatlonal Code
Council, 2006 edition, and the amendments to those codes, as contained in this
Ordinance # 07-08, are hereby adopted as amended and declared to be pubiic records
by this Ordinance #07-08. At least three (3) copies of each Code and its corresponding
amendments, if any, shall be filed in the Clty Clerk’s offloe and kept avallable for public
use and mspeotlon ' : :

International Bwldmg Code, :nciudmg Appendlx C.
Intemational Residential Code

International Elecirical Code

Intemational Mechanical Code

Intermational Plumbing Code

International Fuel Gas Code _
International Energy Conservation Code
International Property Maintenance Code
International Existing Buu!dmgs Code
_Internatlonal Fire Code '

F’IQTWDDW?

Sectlon 2. The foliownng changes are made o the Surpnse Munlolpal Code, Chapter
15: :

15.04.010 Construchon Codes '
The following 2008 codes, appendices as oubhshed by the Internat:ona! Code Council

- and amendments to those codes are hereby adopted by the city to regulate -
construction and the improvement of structures within the territorial limits of the city, and
are incorporated in this section by reference as though they had been fully and _
completely set forth in this section. At least three (3) copies of each shall be filed in the
City Clerk’s office and kept available for public use and inspection:

A. The Interna’tlonai Building Code including Appendix C 2993«-a-s—pubhehed—by
the-International-Code-Counell;

. The Intemnational Residential Code 2998—as—pubhshed—by4he—h:|tema¢|enal
Gode Counsil;

B
C. The lntematlonal Fire Code 2993~as—pabkshed—by—th&mtemaﬁoﬁa4-€ede
D

Council;

D. The international Electric Code 2993—as—peellshed—by—the—mtemat|enaLGede
GCeuneil;

Ordinance #07-08 2
JAune 7, 2p07




. The Intemational Mechamoal Code 2993—as—pﬁbhshed—by—the—lmemahenal
Code Council;

E

F. The Interational Property Malntenance Code 2993—aseubhshed49y-me
intematienal Gode Council;

G. The-siate intemational Plumblng Code

H. Intemnational Fuel Gas Code: :

l. _International Energy Conservation Code:

J. [nternational Existing Bmlqus Code;

K. The code amendments w :

State Law Reference Adop’uon by Reference A R S § 9 801 ot seq

Deletion of Sections 1 through Section 8 of Chapter 15 04 in its entlrety These _
amendments, as below wﬂi be adopted by Councﬂ as below and kept as separate .
documents. _ - _

' Section 3. The Intemational B'uil'ding C_od_e 2006 a_mend'r_r.ient.s are edopted as follows:

1. Chapter 1, ADMINISTR'ATION'

a. 101.1, insert the words “Clty of Surpnse as the name of
junsdlctlon "Also add: “The fees and administrative provisions of
Chapter 1 of this code shall apply to all the adopted technical

- codes. Where there is a conflict between these provisions and
those of another technical code, these provisions shall apply.
Where there is an administrative provision contained in another
technical code and not in this code, then the administrative

- provision of the technxcal code shall apply.”

b, 101 4, delete the text of the sectlon and réplace wath the following
language: “Referenced codes. The other codes listed in 101.4.1
through 101.4.7 and referenced elsewhere in this code shall be
considered part of the requirements of this code to the prescribed
extent of each reference. If another code is referenced elsewhere
in this code and has not been adopted, then that sectlon shall be '
consrdered invalid.”

Ordinance #07-08 : 3

June 7, 2007




Crdinance #07-08
June 7, 2007

c. 105.3. 2, delete the text of the section and replace with the follow:ng

language “An application for a permit for any proposed work shall -
be deemed to have been abandoned 30 days after the date of _
issuance notification, uniess such application has been pursued in
good faith or a permit has been issued; except that the Building
Official is authorized to grant one extension of time for an additional
period of 30 days. The extension shall be requested in writing prlor_
to the expiration of the application, and justifiable cause
demonstrated. To reinstate an application after expiration, a full
new plan review fee shall be assessed except as approved by the
Burldlng Official.” - _ _

. 105.5, delete the text of the section and replace wnth the foiiewmg_ :

language: “Every permit issued shall become invalid unless the .
work authorized by such permit is. commenced and required
mspec’tion(s) afre requested by the permlttee and approved by the.
Building Official within 90 days after- its issuance, or if more than
180 days elapses between approval of required inspection(s). The

‘Building Ofiicial shall be authorized to grant one extension of time
for a period not o exceed 180 days. Permits shall not be extended

more than once and all requests for extension shall be in writing
prior to the expiration of the permit, and justifiable cause
demonstrated.  In' order to renew action on a permit after
expiration, a new full permit: fee shall be paid based on the current
fee schedule adopted by the Clty, except as approved by the

- Building Official.”

. 108 3, add the followmg paragraph “For purposes of determmmg

valuations, the most current building valuation data as published by
the Intemational Code Council in Building Safety Journal
magazine, as such data is publ!shed from time to time, shall be
used, as applicable. The valuation for any shell-only buﬂdmg shall
be pemutted to be reduced by 20% S

108.4, add the followmg paragraph “This fee shall be equal to the
amount of the permit fee required by the adopted fee schedule, .
except as approved by the Building Official. The payment of such

fee shall not exempt an applicant from all other provisions of either

- this code or other requirements nor from the penalty prescnbed by .

law.”




Ordinance #07-08
Jdung 7, 2007

g 108 B, delete the text of the sectlcn and replace with the follcwmg

language: “The Building Official shall be permitied to authorize

~ refunding of a fee paid hereunder which was erroneously paid or

collected. - The Building Official shall be permitted to authorize
refunding of not more than 80 percent of the permit fee paid when

-~ no work has been done under a permit issued in accordance with
~ this code.  The Building Official shail be permitted to authorize

refunding of not more than 80 percent of the plan review fee paid
when an apphcatlon for a permit for which a plan review fee has

- been paid is withdrawn or canceled before any examination time

has been expended. The Building Official shall be authorized to

- waive the plan review fee for an expired permit for which no
~ additional plan review is required. The Building Official shall not be - -
- permitted to authorize refunding of any permit fee paid except upon

written application filed by the original perm:ttee not Iater than 180

- days after the date cf fee payment »
2. Chapter2 DEFINITIONS

- a. 201.3, delete the text of the sectlcn and replace wnth the follcwmg ; -
‘“When terms are not defined in thls code and are defined in .

another adopted code, such terms shall have the meanmgs'
aecnbed to them in those codes,” : . _ .

. 201.4, delete the text of the section and roplace with the following

language:  “Where terms are not defined through the methods

authorized by this section, such terms shall have ordinarily
accepted meanings such as the context implies. Webster's Third:

New international Dictionary of the English Language, Unabnclged
shall be consn:lered as providing erdlnarliy accepted meanlngs "

3 Chap’ter 3, USE AND OCCU PANCY CLASSIFICATION

a. 308.2 Grcup_l-1, delete the text of the section and replace with the

following language: ‘This occupancy shall include buildings,

_structures, or parts thereof housing moreé than 10 persons, ona 24-'

hour basis, who because of age, mental disability or other reasons,
live in a residential environment that provides supervisory care
services. The occupanis are capable of responding to an
emergency situation without physical assistance from staff. This
group shall include but not be limited to the following:

Resu:!entlal board and care facilities
Assisted living centers

- Haifway houses
Group homes




Congregate care facilities
Social rehabilitation facilities -
Alcohol and drug abuse centers
Convalescent facilities :

A facility such as the above wrth 10 or fewer persons shatl be
classified as A Group R-4 Condition 1 or shall comply with the -
“international Residential Code in accordance with 101.2 where =
the burldrng is in complrance with Section 421 of this code L

b.. 308. 3 Group -2, delete. the text of the sectlon and repiace wuth the‘_ g

_ fcllowmg Ianguage “This occupancy shall lnclude buildings or

‘structures used for medical, ‘surgical, psychiatric, nursing, custodial,

personal, or directed care on a 24-hour basis of more than five (5) = :
persons who are not capable of self-preservation by respondingto

~an emergency situation without physical assistance from staff. This
- group shall snclude but not be hmrted to the followmg

Hosprtafs ' ' '

Nursing homes (both intermedlate care and skllled nursmg
. facilities) . . . - '

Mental hospitals .

Detoxification facilities

o A facrlity such as the above with five or fewer persons shall be o : o
~ classified as group R-3 or shall comply with the Internatronai e

F{esrdentral Code i rn accordance with 101 2

: ThlS occupancy shall atso :nclude bwld:ngs and structures used o

for assisted living homes providing supervisory, personal, or
directed care on a 24-hour basis to more than 10 persons who .
are not capable of self-preservation by responding to an
emergency situation without physical assistance from staff. A
facility such as the above with 10 or fewer persons shall be'

: 'classrﬁed as R- 4 Condltron 27 : .

c. 310.1, Group Ft—4 detete the text of the section, and rep!ace wrth ‘
the fottowrng language:  “Residential occupancies shall include
buildings arranged for occupancy as residential care/assisted I:vrng_

~ homes inciuding not more than 10 occupants, exc!udlng staff.

Ordinance #07-08- ' o 6
dune 7, 2007 -



'31011 Ccndltlcn 1. This cccupancy ccndltlcn shall mclude
fac;lltles licensed to provide supervisoty care services, in which

‘occupants are capable of seif-preservation by responding to an -

. emergency situation without' physical assistance from staff.
- .Condition 1 facilities housing ‘more than 10 persons shall be
' class:fred asa Grcupl -1. ' . :

'31012 Ccndrtlcn 2. Thls cccupancy condmcn shall :nclude'-

facilities licensed tc prcvrde personal or directed care services, in-+ -

which cccupants are incapable of self-preservation by responding

to an emergency situation without physical assistance from staff.
~ Condition 2 facilities hcusmg mcre than 10 perscns shall be -
- classn‘red as Group -2, : :

R-4 occupancres shall meet the requ:remen’ts fcr constructlcn as "

.' defined in Group R-3 except as otherwise provided for in this code - -'

and Section 421 or shall comply with the Intemational Residential
. Code in accordance with 101.2, where the bwldlng isin comphance R
: wrth Sect|on 421 of thzs code S _

- d. .'310 2, Deflnitlons delete the defmmcn fcr Perscnal Care Semce
and replace wuth the fcllowmg L :

Perscnal Care Ser\nce Assustance wrth actnntres cf dally llvmg :
that can be performed by persons without professional skills or-
_ professrcnal iraining and includes the coordination or provision-
- of intermiftent nursing . ser\nces and the admamstratlcn of -

: 'medlcatlcns and treatments. : S :

. Delete the defmltrcn for Fiesmientlal Care/Assusied lezng Facrllty -_
~and replace with the follcwmg . -

Resudent:al Care/Assnsted meg Home A bu;ldlng or part therecf
 housing a maximum of 10 persons, excluding ‘staff, on a 24-hour
~ basis, who because of age, mental disability or other reasons, live
" in a supervised residential environment which provides supervisory,
~ personal or directed care sefvices. This classification shall include,
but not be limited to, the following: residential board and care .
facilities, assisted living homes, halfway houses; group homes, .
congregate care faciiities, social rehabilitation facilities, alcchcl and
drug abuse centers and convalescent facrlrtles

Add the follcwmg deflnltlons

Supervnsorv Care Servrce General supennszon including dally
awareness of resuclent functlonlng and ccntmu:ng needs

Ordinance #07-08 ' 7
CJune 7, 2007 .



4. Chapter 4, SPECIAL DETAILED F{EQUIF{EMENTS BASED ON USE T
~ AND OCCUPANCY

Ordinance #07-08 -

June 7, 2007

~ Directed Care Services. Care of residents, including personal

care seivices, who are. incapable of recognizing danger, = -

summoning asmstance expressrng need or maklng basic care "
decnsmns o _ T .

a Add a new _Sectlon 421 Resrdentlal Care/Ass;sted Lnnng Homes as R

fcilows

o 421 1 Appllcabmty The provrsrens of thls sectlon shall app!y to a' -
- building or - part- thereof housing not more than 10 persons_

excluding staff, on a 24-hour basis, who because of age, mental

. disability or other reasons, live- in a supervised residential - .
. environment, which provides licensed care services.: Except as .. -

specifically required by this division, R-4 occupanc:es shall rneet all "

_ apphcable prov:snons of Group R- 3

: 421 2 General Bunldmgs or pcrt:ons of buﬂdlngs classxfied as R4 |
- occupancies shall meet all the applicable provisions of Group R-3,

may be constructed of any materlals allowed by this code, shall not

exceed two stories in height nor be located above the second story
- in any building and shall not exceed 2000 square feet above the -
flrst story, except as provrded in Sectlon 506 o] -

- 4213 Specral Prowsmn Fi-4 occupancues havmg more than 2000'__
square feet of floor area above the first floor shall be of not less
: than one- hour fsre-reasttve constructlcn throughcut :

421.3. 1 Mlxed Uses F{ 4 cccupancres shall be separated from'
other occupancies as provided in Table 508.3.3. :

- 4214 Access and Means of Egress Fac:lltles

' 421 41 Accessmlhty R- 4 eccupanmes shall be prowded w:th at

ieast one accessrble route per the Arlzonans wrth Dlsabllltres Act

' Exceptron Emstlng bwldmgs shall comply with Section 3409

Bathing and toilet facilities need not be made accessible, but shall -

| be prc\nded with grab bars in accordance wrth ICC/ANSI A1 17.1.

421 4 2 Exrts

421 421 Number of Exits. Every story, basement or portlon

_thereef shall have not Iess than two exrts




Ordinance #07-08
June 7, 2007

Exceptlon Basements and stories above the first floor contaming
no sleeping rooms used by residenis may have one means of-
egress as provrded in Chapter 10.

421 422 Dlstance to Exrts The maximum travel dlstance shali'
comply with Section 10186, except that the maximum travel distance
from the center pomt of any sleepmg room to an exrt shall not"_' 3
exceed 75 teet S

421 4 2 3 Emergency Exat Itlumlnatlon In the event of a power.

failure, exit illumination shall be automatically provided from an

emergency system powered by storage batteries or an onsite
generator set lnstalied in accordance wuth the lnternatlonal Electnc o
Code _

421 4 2. 4 Emergency Escape and Rescue R 4 occupancres shall' -

comply with~ the requirements of . Section 1026, except that-"__-__

Except:on 1 to 1026 1 does not appiy to R- 4 occupancres

421 4 2 5 Delayed Egress Locks In R-4 Condltion 2 occupanmes |
delayed egress locks shall be permitied in accordance wrth
1008134and1008186|tems1 245and6 :

421 5 Smoke Detectors and Sprinkler Systerns _
42151 Al ‘habitable. rooms and hallways. and R-4 occupanmes-
shall be prowded wrzh smoke alarms lnsta!led in accordance wrth o
907. 2 10 .

421 5 2 Spnnkler Systems R-4 occupancies shail be prowded'
with a sprinkler system instafled in accordance with 903.3.1.3.

Sprinkler systems installed under this section shall be installed
throughout, including attached garages, and in Condition 2
facilities, "shall include . concealed. spaces of or containing
combustible = materials: Such. systems may not contain-
unsupervised valves between the domestic water riser control valve
and the spnnklers In R-2 Condition 2 occupancies, such systems

shall contain water flow swiiches electrically” supervised by an-
approved supervising station, and shall sound an aud:ble stgnal at
a constantly attended Iccatlon

5 Chapter 5, GENERAL BUILDING HEIGHTS AND AREAS

a. Add a new Section 509 Loca’uon On Property




Ordinance #07-08

June 7, 2007

- 509.1 General Buudrngs shall adjom or have access to a pubho. .
way or yard on not less than one side. Requ:red yards shall be . =
permanently ma;ntamed : _

For the purpose of thls sectron the center Ilne of an adjomlng .
- public way shall be consudered an ad]acent property Ilne (see also :
_ _Sectlon 1206) R : R o

' Required yards and al! sewer and water serwces shall be on the

$same property as the bu;ld:ng, and no building or sewer or water -

" seivice shall be built across a recorded property llne except in - o
e acoordance W|th the followang provrsrons R

_}Utrhty Easements A modrflca’oon request if requnred to e

approve the provrsnon of private sewer or water services to a
lot or buriding site when such service is. located within a
permanent, nonrevocable private utility easement  duly-

- recorded with- the. Manoopa County Recorder for all the s

propertles involved.
Lot Combrnatlons Where two or more adjacent Iots or'
parcels are owned by the same person or persons, such lots - -
or parcels shall be combined into'a single building site by -

platting or replatting such lots or parcels into a single lot, or

- shall be comblned by recordlng with the Maricopa County
_Recorder a permanent, nonrevocable lot combination .
- agreement in a form approved by the Bunldlng Official for all

of the lots or parcels involved. In addition, the property
owner shall provide evidence that all of the Iots or parcels

" combined are taxed and assessed by the Maricopa County "

Assessor as a single tax parce! _
Integrated Developments  with Multlple Owners As a

‘medification to the building code, the Building Official may
"approve a permanent agreement between multipie property
~ owners for purposes of considering two or more separately .
owned properties as one building site for purposes of this-

code. Such agreement shall stipulate the reasons for the lot-

-'i'_consolldatlon and. the permanent requirements of - :

prohibitions neoessary to fully comply with this code as if alt L '

improvements were 1ocated on the same single lot. _ .
Open Space Easements. As a modification to the building -

- code, the Building Official may approve a permanent open -

B space, nonbuilding easement on one property for purposes :

R ~of providing yard areas or open space sufficient to satisfy

building code sethack or egress requurements on the

_ ad;acent property

10




5 Agreement Condttlons Agreements prOposed or requrred o

under this section shall be permanent and binding on all

property owners, their heirs and assigns. The agreements
~shall be in writing, shall be approved by the Building Official
~and shall be recorded with the Maricopa County Recorder -

- for all the properties involved. The agreements shall be
enforceable by the Bu:ldtng Off:ola! and by each of the

property owners, their heirs and assrgns The agreements

‘shall require physrcal modlflcatlons of any structures to fully.

. comply with - all applicable code ' requirements. prior to
" alteration or expiratlon of the agreement Alteration of the

"agreements -or- any condition or- provision thereln or-'._ )
expiration * or: elrrnlnatlon of any such agreement, s -

- - prohibited except with- the prior written. approval of the

Building Official. The Building Official shall have authorlty o -

. révoke any agreement for noncomphance with any of its
~ provisions, and thereafter.io require the property owners to -
~ individually’ make search of their properties physrcatly and -

~ fully compliant with all applicable code requirements without =

. benefit of the. agreement: conditions. The Burldlng Official ..
~ shall not initiate or negotiate any such ‘agreement, but shall

- constder agreements offered ]orntiy by ad]acent property .
owners ' : : _ L -

'- 6. Chapter9 FIRE PROTECT]ON SYSTEMS

.__a-.

901. t add the followmg paragraph “Wherever the words “Buﬂdlng S
Official” appear in Sections 901 through 911 they shall be deleted

~and the words “Fire Chief” shall be inserted in lieu thereof. Code
sections preceded by [F] shall be considered to be maintained and -
_administered under the International Fire Code. Where there is a

~ conflict regarding fire suppression systems and/or atarms between-
this code and the Flre Code the Flre Code shall prevalt " o

_901 5, delete the Iast sentence and repiace wrth the follow:ng _.
language: - “ft shall be unlawful to use, occupy, or furmish any
- portion of a structure until the fire protection systems of the'-'

' structure have been tested and approved "

Ordinance #07-08 . -

Jdune 7, 2007

'_ 903 2 delete the text ot the sect:on retalnlng the exceptlon and
replace with- the following language - “Except  as otherwise. -~

'exempted by the Fire Chief, including cases of minor repair, minor

- additions, changes in occupancy and low fire load, a complete -

automatic sprinkler system shall be installed - throughout all new

' burldrngs and struotures regutated by this oode -

. .11._....




: 7 Chapter10 MEANS OF EGRESS

Ordmance #07- 08
_ June? 2007

a.

1008 1.2, deiete the text of Exceptton 4 and replace with the
- following language: “Doors within or serving a single dwelhng unlt :

o |n Groups R-2 and R- 3 as appllcable in 101 2 and R 4,

8 Chapter 11 ACCESS!BEL!TY

.a_..

1 101 1, delete the text of the sect:on and replace with the follcw:ng' 5
language: “The provisions of this chapter and the Arizona Revised

" Statutes (ARS) Section 41-1492 through 41- 1492 12 shall control .

‘the” design and construction - of fac:!ztles for accesszbmty to

physwatiy d!sabled perscns

11012, deiete the text of the sectlon and replace w;th the foiiowmg'.?' |

. language: - ‘Buildings and facilities * shall  be’ desugned ‘and
' constructed to be accessible in accordance ‘with this code, ICC -

A117.1, and in accordance with the provisions of. the State of

E - Arizona Attorney General Administrative Rules R-10-3-401 through "
- R-10-3-404, whichever standard provides the greater degree of

accessﬂouhty This dual-reference provision shall app!y in al! cases L

where ICC A1 17 1 |s referenced in thls chapter S

. 110324 add the followmg sentences “Home occupatlons as”_'_ o
" defined in the_ Surpnse Municipal Code are not requ:red to be
accessible. “For all other combinations of businesses in Group R
. occupancies, the business portron shall bse accessrble and shall - .
inciude a minimum of one accessible toilet room and an ‘accessible

route from the business portion to the accessible toilet room,

'- accesslble parklng space and pubhc srdewalk T

. 11032 6 add the followmg sentences “The pubhc portuons of o
~ temporary sales offices/trailers’ are required io. be accessible. | -

- There shall be accessible parking and an accessible route from the i
- accessible parking aisle to the sales office/trailer and throughout .~

the public poriion of the sales officeftrailer, including the design -
center. Accessrble to:let rooms shail be prowded accordlng to thIS.
code '

11092 add the fol[owmg sentence “A paraphernalla shelf -

“mounted 48" maximum abo_ve the fln:shed ﬂoor shall be prowded |

at all accessrbie tonlets "

Exceptions: 4. deleted e

12



f. 1109.2.2, add the following sentence: “A baby chang:ng station -

- shali not be focated within a water closet compartment .
g. 1109.3, delete exception, add hew except:ons -
- 1. Manufacturing process sinks .~ .~
2. Ccmmercra! snnks in kitchens otherthan hand smks

. 9 Chapter12 INTERIOR ENVIRONMENT

a. 12071 add the fo!lcwrng at the_ end ct the sentence and
bunldmgs as descrlbed in 12074” SR S

:b..-_-.12074 (new) add the fcllcw:ng sect!on 120? 4'. Sound"

Attenuation. - In’ ‘order’ to achleve an interior noise level of 45 - |

-~ decibels in areas within the noise contours described in A.R.S..

Section 28-8461, paragraph 8, subdivision (a), (b) or (c), as '.
_'appllcabte the following types of ccnstructlon shall ccmply W|th thes-.- S

- prowsrons ct thls sectlon and 207 4 1

. All new development and construction of port;ons ot'

buntdlngs where the publrc is rece:ved
2. Office areas; T : o
3 ‘Where normal n0|se Ievel is low tor flrst occupancy, . -
If the gross floor area of a structure or project is expanded"" '

| : by less than 50%, the requirements of this section apply -
. only to the area of expansion. If the gross floor area ofa . -

- structure or project is expanded by 50% or more, the
o requwements of thls SeCtIOt't apply to the entlre structure '

| Except:cn Anclllary bu:ldlngs used in agrlcultural Iand use
are not subject tc the ccnstructlon standards contalned -
herein o . _ :

. 1207.4.1 Cert_lflc_ation.' A ceriified statement by a licensed architect
or engineer, certifying that the building achieves the requirement of
. a maximum interior noise level of 45 decibels is required for all
construction. The certrfled statement shall mclude documentatlon. o
" supportlng the statement. : : . '

Ordinance #07-08 o e 13
June7,2007 : o a




1o.cﬁa';5ter 16, STRUCTURAL DESIGN

a. Table 1607 1 revrse item 28 to read as follows.

OCCUPANCY OR USE =

UNIFORM--

CONCENTRATED

_ (bs) -

28 Residential
One- and m'o-famliy dwelilngs

Hébitéb_le aﬁiqs én_d s_Ieéping_are_as {40

_{psf)

_"1_1.

_June 7, 2007

Chapter 29 PLUMBING SYSTEMS
a Table 2902 1 rev:se ttems #2 and #6 to read as foilows
o TABLE 2902 1 - -
MINIMUM NUMBER OF REQUIRED PLUMBING FICI\CILITIESEl
| WATER DRINKING
CLOSETS, (.SEE FOUNTAINS
SECTION . 419.2 T {8EE - -. -
OF THE o CBECTION - |
INTERNATIONAL - #4101 OF THE |-
PLUMBING -~ {. a— INTER- "~
| CODE . "FOR| .- = - BATHTUBS NATIONAL - - _
o USE - o ’ URINALSY . . LAVATORIES - - CR. “PLUMBING - | .. )
No. CLASSIFICATION GROUP| DESCRIPTION © | MALE |FEMALE MALE IFEMALE HOWERS ICODE) . OTHER
Buildings for the Y e i :
transaction of -
business,
_ . I professional ' ' S o
" Business (see sefvices, . other | 1 per 25 for the | 1 per 40 ior the first o i .
" .. | Sections 2202.2, . - services first 50 and + 50 and 1 per 80 for — 1 per 100 _

2. | 2802.4,290241 | B. involving per 58 for  the | the remainder - - A
and 2902.6) ' merchandise, remainder - exceeding 50
S oftice  buildings, | excesding 50 s

banks, . . B
tight industrial
and :
sirmilar uses
o Retaii stores,
S o senvice . .

6 Mercantile (sece | M- | stations, shops, - o R B
Section 2802.2, salesrooms, 1 per 50¢ 1per750 - — 1 per 1,000 _
2902.5 and markets ’ ) : ]
28026} . and  shopping

centers ]
Ordinance #07-08 14




o b 29022 add Exceptron#4 as foilows
_ .4 “Separate facrlltles shatl not be requnred in business
oc¢cupancies in which the maximum occupant load is 25 or less, .o
. if a rational analysis indicates that a unisex facility is suﬁ:c;ent S
o subject to the approval of the Bu:tdlng Off:crai A :
'_'12 Ghapter 31 SPECIAL CONSTRUCTION _3 B
a 3109 deiete |n tts entlrety o

Sectlon 4 The Intemataonal Resrdential Code 2006 amendments are adopted as_:f' '

o foilows

Chapter 1, ADMINISTRATION

AR a. F{1011 msert the words “Clty of Surpnse as the name off. S
Junsdlct;on o ey R

b Ft102 5, add the fol!owmg sentence at the end of the sectlon "The? - |
- provisions of appendlce_s G (as amended) H and K (as amended).
aehersbyadopted” .t

. c_?. ~R105. 2 delete the words “24 mches (610mm)” in sub~paragraph _;. L
S Bunidrng #7 and replace wrth “18 mches (454 mm) e .

d: F{105 3. 2, deiete the text of the sectlon and repiace wrth the
.- - following language: “An application for a permit for any proposed
- work shall be deemed to have been abandoned 30 days after the -
. date of issuance notification, unless such application has been " .
. pursued in good faith or a permit has been issued; except that the -
- Building Official is authorized to grant one extension of time for an
~ additional period of 30 days. The extension shall be requested in -
 writing prior o the expiration of the application, and justifiable -
- cause demonstrated. To reinstate an appllcat:on after expiration a
. full new plan review fee shall be assessed except as approved by
the Burldtng Oﬁtmai LA .

E Ordma.nce#O?OB R L
June? 2007 S o : -




e. R1055 delete the text of the sectlon and repiace wrth the followmg S

language:  “Every permit issued shall become invalid unless the .

- work authorized by such permit is commenced and required.
' inspection(s) are requested by the permitiee and approved by the © .
- Building Official within 30 days after its issuance, or if more than 60 -~

days. elapses between approval of required rnspectlon(s) The;".j'

- Building Official shall be authorized to grant one extension of time = .

. -._for a period not to exceed 60 days. Permits shall not be extended - -

. more than once and all requests for extensions shall be in wr:tmg L

© prior to the expiratlon of the. perrmt and jUStlflable cause
demonstrated ~In- order to renew. action' on a permit after-. -
e explratlon a new full permit fee-shall be paid based onthe current. - =
..~ fee schedule adopted by the City, except as approved by the e

Burldrng Offlc:al " ' o

R A R108 2 delete the text of the sectlon and replace wuth the follow:ng ._: ) .
. Ianguage " “Building permit fees shall be estabhshed by Cl’ty_:' S

s e Counoll from time to time by resolutlon -

.-\F{1101 delete the text of the sectlon retalnlng the exceptlon and S
.- replace with the following l[anguage: . “No burld:ng or structure shall -+
-+ be 'used, occupied. or furnished in whole or in part, and no change' & -
. in the existing occuparncy classification of a building of structure or ..~ -
- portion- thereof shall be made until-the Building Official has - . .

o inspected the bwldmg or structure and finds no violations of the -~ .~

" provisions of this code of other ordinances of the jurisdiction. Upon .~ -

written request of the original permittee and aiter payment of any -

prescnbed fees, the Buald:ng Official shall issue a certificate’ of

.| occupancy as: prov;ded herein, !ssuance of a certificate of
- occupancy shall not be construed as an approval of a violation of .

. the provisions of this code or of other ordinances of the jurisdiction. =
~Certificates presuming to give authority o violate or cancel the =~ -
- provisions of this code or of other ordlnances of the jurlsdlotlon' C
- shall not be valid " . _ . S -

2 Chapter 2 DEFINITIONS

Crdinance #07;08

7 Jume 7, 2007

- a. R201 4 delete the text of the sectlon and replace W|th the followrng :

language: “Where terms are not defined through the methods . -

‘authorized by this section, such terms shall have ordinarily
accepted meanings such as the context implies.. Webster's Third

New International Dictionary of the English Language Unabridged,

o shall be cons&dered as prowdl_ng ordinarily accepted meanings.”




* Ordinance #07-08

- June 7, 2007

3 Chapters BUILDING PLANNING

. a.f

Table R301 2(1) msert the followmg desagn criteria: “Roof Snow

‘Load: 0; Wind speed: 90 mph, Exposure B (unless otherwise

designated by-the Building Official); Seismic Design Category: B;
Weathering:. NEGLIGIBLE; Frost Line Depth: 127 . Temnite: -

MODERATE TO HEAVY: Decay: NONE TO SLIGHT; Winter =

Design Temperature: 34 degrees F; Flood Hazards: Date of entry.

i rnto Natlonal FIood Insurance Prograrn June 28, 1974 ?

Table RSO'I 5 change the Iwe Ioad limit for sleeplng rooms from 30-'._._-j o
_to40 R : . - _ T

_FI302 1 add exceptlon #4 “When the waII is at 5’ or greater to the':-'-

property line, with no attic vents or gabie end vents a maxumum of__ _

187 unprotected eave overhang is perrmtted ”

R309 1 de__lete the text of the sec’tlon and replace wuth the foIIowmg'_ -
- language:" “Opemngs from a private garage direcily into a room -
- used for sleepmg purposes shall not be permitted. Other openings. -

between the garage and residence shall be equipped with solid

- wood doors not less than 1% inch (35 mm) in thickness, solid or - :
- honeycomb core steel doors not less than 1% inches (35 mm)_-' o
- thick, or 20-minute fire-rated doors. - Doors provudrng openlng-'- .

i protectlon shall be malntalned self closmg and seif Iatchlng

Sectlon R313 rewse the trtle of the Sectlon fo read - R
SIVIOKE ALARMS,- - HEAT DETECTION AND CARBON R

' MONOXIDE DETECTION

. R3132 Locatlon itorn 2. Add the followrng sentence “In such:'-___'_
" locations, a combination smoke alarm/carbon monoxide detector

listed for interconnechon wrth the other smoke alarms shall be -
- installed.” : _

-~ repairs, or additions requiring a permit occur, ...,  the individual - |

R313.2.1, Alteratl'ons repairs, and additions, delete the text of the

section and replace with the following language “When alterations,

dwelling unit shall be equipped with smoke alarms and carbon'

- monoxide detectlon Iocated as requrred for new dwell;ngs . (no

_other changes)

47




- Ordinance #07-08

~June 7, 2007

h R3133 Add a new sectlon "‘H'eat detection. In an enclosed _

garages attached to a residence, or in detached garages where

habitable space is provided, a UL-listed heat detector shall be R

interconnected with the household smoke alarm system”

. R313.4, re-number  313.3, Power source, delete the text of the'-'_ R
. section- and replace with the following" language:- “ In: new - - -
o construction the required smoke alarms, carbon: ‘monokide -
_+ detectors, and heat detectors shall recelve thelr prlmary power S

I(no other changes) R, : . o

4 Chapter 13 GENEF{AL MECHANICAL SYSTEM REQUIF{EMENTS

a. M13073 delete the toxt ol the sectlon and" rep!ace wsth the-'__ S
_following language “Appliances hawng an ignition source shalibe .~ .
- elevated such that the source of ignition is not less than 18 inches - =
. (457 mm) above the floot in ‘garages. For the purpose of this- "
" section, rooms or spaces that are not part of the living space ofa
o dwelllng unit and that communicate with a private garage through-,_"u; L
R opemngs shal! be con3|dered to be part of the pnvate garage e T

Exceptlon Clothes dryers mstalled :n prlvate garages i =

5 Chapter 24 FUEL GAS

Cas 24159 delete the fext’ of the sectlon and the subsectron and'_' T
o replace with the fotlowmg language: “Underground piping systems = = . .
- shall be installed a minimum depth of 12 inches below grade for -
" metal plplng and 18 tnches for plastrc plplng o '

6. Chapter 29 WATER SU PPLY AND DISTRIBUTION
a P29034 delete the text of the sectlon and replace wrth the |

. followrng language: “Maximum static préssure for water distribution: -~
- piping shalt be 80 psi (551 kPa). ' An approved pressure-reducing . -

valve conformlng to ASSE 1003 shall be instalied on the domestic

water branch maln or rrser at the connectlon to the water—servxce R
plpe . . . o

18



7 Chapter 36 BF{ANCH CIRCUETS AND FEEDER REQUIREMENTS

- .ampere-rated branch circuits shall be provided to serve receptacles -~ ¢ |
located in the kitchen, pantry, breakfast area and dining area.. The - .
‘kitchen countertop receptacles shall be served by a minimum of -

E3603 2, delete the text cf the sectron retain ‘the exceptlcn and- :
replace with the. following ianguage ‘A minimum of two 20- -

. two 20-ampere-rated branch circuits, either or both-of which shall -

o _ also be permitted to supply other: receptacle - outlets in the kitchen, _
- pantry, breakfast area and dining area, including receptacle outlets_ R
- for refngerat!cn appliances. - Dishwasher and garbage disposer. - -

o _shall be permitted to be on the same 20-ampere branch C|ch|t ”

8 Append!x G SW!MMING POOLS SPAS AND HOT TUBS

'a.

The wall fence or barrrer shall be at least 20 lnches from the Co |

AG 102 de!ete the deflnrtlcn fcr “Swmmlng Pcot” and replace wrth _
“Any structure intended for swimming or recreatlonal bathing that .~

contains ‘water over 18 inches (457 mm} deep at any point and,

other than hot tubs and spas is wider than 8 feet (2400 mm) atany
© point. - This includes  in-ground, above ground .and on-ground.
_ swrmrmng pccls and other than the wrdth hot tubs and spas P

AG 105 2 add the follcwnng sentences to sub-paragraph #1 “Any’-"' "
- decorative desrgn work on. a barner located entlrely on the subject - -~
- parcel, and on the side away from the swimming pool, such as -

protrusions, indentations or cutouts or. other fixed or movable,
attached or unattached cbjects within twenty-four inches of the pocl
barrier, which render the barrier easily climbable are prchrblted >

- waters edge.”

Ordinance #07-08 .
June 7, 2007, -

AG 105 2, detete the text of sub—paragraph #6 and replace W|th the -' |

~ following language “Chain Irnk tencmg shall not b_e _used_as a.
-barrler e A _

] AG 105 2, add the followmg subsectlcn 8. 3 to sub-paragraph #8 o
“8.3 All pedestrian access gates and other access gates shall have

- a sign attached to both sides of the gate stating the following:

- “Protect Your Children, Keep Gates Ciosed.” Details of minimum =

sign size, letter type and color and other spec:frcatlcns of the s:gn_ -

: shall be provrded by the Buridmg Safety Department 7

19



Ordtnanc_e #0?-08

June 7, 2007 -

AG 105.2, defete the text of subsectlon 91 of sub-paragraph #9_ a

- ‘and replace with the following language: - “The pool will be . _
‘protected by a motorized safety cover which requires the operation - " -
“of a key switch which meets the American Society of Testing .« =
Materrals standard 13- 89 and which does not requrre manual'{ :

: operatlon otherthan the use ofakey swrtch or” e

f.. AG 105 2 add the foltowmg subsectrons to sub paragraph #9
- _ 9 4 Add the Self-closmg and self !atchlng dewces lnstalled on all" B -

<" dodrs with direct access o the pool area, with the release i
. mechanism located a mrnlmum of flfty—four mches above the - .~

ﬂoor _' .

9 AG105 2 add the tollowmg sub-paragraph #11

i 11 Pet doors WhtCh prowde dlrect access to the pool area are o

- prohibited.” - o
o Exceptlon Pet doors frtted wrth a permanent barner in .
- comphance wrth AG105 2 Item 2 S :

| | AG 105 2 add the followmg sub paragraph #12

12 “Wlndcws wrth access to the pooi areas wrll be protected |n

the fol!owrng ways

o 1. Emergency escape or rescue wrndows from sieeprng SENT
areas with access to the swimming pool w;ll be equipped - -

with a latchrng devrce not Iess than fifty-four rnches above
the floor o o _ :

- 2. All other openable windows with similar access will also

be equipped with a laiching device not less than fifty-four =

inches above the floor or shall be ‘equipped with key lock =

device that prevents opemng the. wmdow niore than four

_rnches

AG 105 6 (new) add the followmg sectron

a AG105 6 Fletroactmty The owner of every dwelhng with an R
. existing swimming pool or spa which was constructed prior 1o

the effective date of this Appendix G (amended) and to which
_thrs Appendix would otherwise apply, must comply with this’
Appendix not later than one year after the effective date of this -

_ _ Appendlx

20



j; AG 105. 7 (new) add the fo!lowrng sect:on

AG1057 Duty to comply Every person who owns, rents .

" occupies of controls a dwellrng with a swimming pool or spa, to =

“which this Appendix G (amended) applies, shall compiy with all. -
provrswns of this Appendix at all trmes ERRT _

- AG105 7 1 No person shall construct or mstali a smmmlng poo!: e

. orspato which this Appendix applles in a manner, which is not
- in-compliance with this Appendix. No person shall remove,
- alter, disable, render inoperable, or change; either temporarlly-'

or pennanently, any device or structure instalied or constructed - - B

i accordance with this Appendix, in such a manner that the

~ device or structure or the barrier to Wthh it is attached or of - |

- 'wh:ch it § rs a part IS no Ionger in comp!tance wrth th:s Appendlx

o AG105 7 2 Every person who contracts to bu:!d a swrmmlng Lol

. pool or spa fo. which this Appendlx app!res or who contracts to
“sell, lease, or rent a dwelling with a swimming pool or spato =
'whrch this Appendix applies, shall, at the time of executing the

~contract, gwe to the buyer Iessee or renter a copy of this _
' Appendlx L - CI L

k AG 105 8 (new) add the fo!lowmg sectlon

AG105 8 Vlolatron and Penaltles Every person who \no!ates -

- any provision of this. Appendlx G (amended) is quity of a =
. misdemeanor, and. upon conviction shall be punished by - -
-.;mpnsonment for up to six months, or by a fine of not more than -

. two thousand five hundred dollars or by both such f:ne and
' lmprlsonment _

L 9 AppendlxK SOUND TRANSMISSION
a. AK1022(new) add the foliowmg sectlon

AK‘I 02 2, Sound Attenuatlcn In order to achleve an [ntenor )
~ noise level of 45 decibels, all residences shall be constructed '
using the following minimum construction standards
' 1. Exterior wall penetrations by pipe ducts or condwts shall
_ - be sealed. L
2. Ma;l boxes shall not be used through the door or wall

3. Windows shall have 2 pahes of glass and asound

Ordinance #07-08 _ Co 21
dune 7, 2{307 I R . ’




transrnlssn.'m ratlng of STC 22 AII operable wzndows -

 shall be weather stripped and air tight in accordance with .~ |
- ASTM E-283-84- T Standard Penmeter wmdow frames IR

shall be sealed.

a4, All exterior side- hmge doors shall be so!nd core wood N
 or insulated hollow metal, at least 1. % inches thick and -
~ fully weather stripped.  All exterior doors other than side
hmge doors shall be solid wood foam frlled ﬁberglass or'

B metal construction. :

- 5. Ftreplaces shall be provuded w1th well flttlng dampers
o 6 Exterior walls shall achieve a mmimum o_veraii

- thermal resistance rating of 19. -

__7 All roof spaces shall achieve a mrnrmum overalf o £

. thermal res:stance ratmg of 30

AK102 21 Certif:catlon A certifled statement by a tlcensed__.'_- S
.- architect or engineer certrfylng that the residence achieves the - .
- requirement of a maximum interior noise level of 45 decibels.is. . -
-, required for all’ construction. - The certified statement shall--_?_-'
o rnolude documentatron supportlng the statement S

Exoeptlon Construotlon outsrde the areas deS|gnated as--'.. L
o having a day—nlght average sound level 65 decibels or higher = - -
;- @as determined by the use of the1988 noise contour lines .~ =~ = -
~ developed. by the Maricopa.. County.- Assomat:on of
- Governments that complies with the construction standards_ C
- of Section 1206.4.1 shall be deemed to have achieved the. - -
. interior noise level of 45 decrbels and shall not requure the A
' _certlfled statement o C R

_ Sectlon 5 The Internat:onal Etectnca{ Code 2006 amendments are adopted as -

L follows

Chapter1 SCOPE
B a Seotlon 101 1 rnsert the words “Clty of Surpnse for the name ot_- _ '-

o the ]urrsdrotton

2 Chapter2 DEFINITIONS

| .: . a. 201.4, delete the text of the sectlon and reptace wuth the followrng -

Ordinance #07-08

June7,2007

- languager “Where terms are not defined through the methods .
authorized by this chapter, such terms shall have ordinarily =

- accepted meanings such as the context implies. Webster's Third - -
- . New International Dictionary of the English Language, Unabndged_ o
o _shatl be oon31dered as provrdlng ordmarily acoepted rneamngs ” :

:...22 o




- 3. Chapter4 PERMITS AND FEES

" Ordinance #07-08

“June 7, 2007 -

a 402.5, delete the text of the sectlon and replace w:th the fol!owmg

language: “An application for a permit for any proposed work shali

' be deemed to have been abandoned 30 days after the date of -

issuance notification, unless such application has been pursued in
good faith or a permit has been issued; except that the Building

- Official is authorized to grant one extension of time for an additlonal-'

" period of 30 days.. The extension shall be requested in writing prior- '
o the expiration of the apphcation and justifiable cause "
- demonstrated. To reinstate an application after expiration, a full -

new plan feview fee shall be assessed except as approved by the e

Bu;ldlng Of'f:mal” E

. 403 2 de[ete the text of the sectlon and replaoe Wlth the followang R
. language:. “Every permit issued shall becomie. invalid unless the _
.. work authonzed by . such permit is commenced and’ required - -

L mspection(s) are requested by the permittee and approved by the - -~ .

~Building Official within 90 days affer its issuance, or if more than* -~~~
180 days e!apses between approval of required inspection(s). The = B
Building Official shall be’ authorized to grant one extension of time *~ -
- for a period not to exceed 180 days. Permits shall not be extended "~~~
~ more than once and all requests for extensions shall be in writing

prior- 1o the expiratlon of the permit, and Justifiable oause_.'

'_demonstrated In" order to renew action. on a permit. after-'-- S :
- expiration, a new full permit fee shall be paid based on the current B
- fee schedule adopted by the Ctty, exoept as approved by the .
' Buuldmg OfflClaI ”o . '

. 404 2, delete the text of the sectlon and replace with the followmg '.

Ianguage - “A fee for each permit shall be paid as required, in

~accordance with the scheduie as estabhshed by the Caty of'

Surprtse

23



d.

" _'no work has been done under a permit issued in accordance with - =

404 5, delete the text of the sectlcn and replace wrth the fcllcwrng -

language: ‘“The Building Official shali be permitted to authorize . - | o
refunding of a fee paid hereunder which was erroneously pador - - .
‘collected. © The Building Official shail be permitted to authorize -

refundrng of not more than 80 percent of the permit fee paid when™ ~

i " this code. The Buﬂding Official shali be permitted to authorize -

o refundrng of not more than 80 percent of the plan review fee paid .
.when an appl:caﬂon for a permit for which a plan review fee has

been paid is withdrawn or canceled before any examination or

- administration time has been expended The Burldlng Official shall
~ not be permitted o authorize refunding of any pemit fee paid @
- ‘except upon written application filed by the original permrttee nct.
o later than 180 aﬁer the date of fee payment i o o o

' 4 Chapter11 MEANS OF APPEAL delete in lts entrrety

R 'a.'

5 Chapter12 ELECTRICAL PROVISIONS

* Ordinance #07-08

- June 7, 2007

12021 1, add the follcwrng sentence “NFPA 70, 2005 Edmcn is R
'__adcpted by reference and is hereby amended as fcllcws LR '

:Chapter 2, WlRiNG AND PROTECTION

"_'210 8 delete the text of the sectlcn and replace W|th the fcllowrng S
'language ST : _ L

210 8 Ground Fault Crrcurt Interrupter Protectlcn for Persennel
~ (A) . All occupancies. All 125-volt, single-phase, 15- and 20-
 ampere receptacles installed in the locations specified in (1)
~ through: (9) shaill have ground- fault crrcurt—lnterruptcr
- protecﬂcn for perscnnel o -

B (1)Bathrocms A o
- {2) Garages, and also accesscry burldmgs that have 4 ﬂoor '
- located at or below grade level not intended as habitable
" rooms and limited to stcrage areas, work areas, and :
areas of similar use. -
- Exception No 1 fo (2) Receptacies that are not read:ly
access:bie . .

24




" Exception No 2 fo (2)7 A single receptacle or duplex -

" . ‘receptacle for two appliances dedicated for each |

: j'appkance that, in normal use, is not easily moved from.

‘one place. to another and that is cord- and. plug -

CE

connected in accordance w:th 4.7 (A)(B) (A)(?) or. BT

Recep’tac!e mstalled under ’the exception to- 210 8 (A)(2)-_"’_ L :
~shall not be, consm_iered as meetlng the requ:rements of X Lo

210. 52(G)
(3) Outdoors

e T 426.28 |
R (4) Crawl Spaces AtOr Below Grade Level
(5) Unfinished Basemients — for purposes of th:s sec’aon

'Exceptron to (3) Receptac!es that are not read:!y_{ S
. "3;:'accessrble and are’ supplied form a dedicated branch
" circuit for electric snow meﬂ‘mg or de:cmg equipment . .
‘.. shall be permrtted to be msz‘aHed m accordance w:fh EEE

unfinished basements are defined as portions or areas of R

the basement not mtended as habltable ‘rooms_and
limited .. R : : '
fo storage areas work areas and the Ilke

" Exception No 1 to (5) Receptac!es that are not readrfy'_”.'

- access;ble

e 'Exceptzon No 2 to (5) A smgle recepfao!e ora duplex ._ o
. receptacle for two- appliances. dedicated for each ..

B “appliance that, in normal usé, is not easily moved from

. one place to another and that is cord-and plug- i:- .' R
connected in accordance wzth 400. 7(A)(6) (A)(?) or’ B IR

o (A)(8).

| Exce,ot:on No 3 to (5) A receptac!e supp!ymg only a -
pennanently instafled fire alarm or burglar alarm system

shall not be required fo  have ground-fauh‘ circuit-

o rnterrupter protectron for personne!

(6) Kltchens - for the purpose of th|s sectlon a kitchen isan

area with a sink and. permanent facmtles for food

preparatlon and cooking. - :
- (@) Dwelling units- - where the receptacies are
instalied to serve countenop surfaces , -
(b} Commercial and institutional kitchens. . _
(7) Sinks — where the réceptacles are mstalled w1th 1.8m (6
o ft ) of the out3|de edge of the smk . . .

. Ordinance #07-08 . ~. - ° R . 25

. June7,2007 .-



b 250. 118 delete the text of the section and rep!ace wrth the foliowmg" R
B !anguage L _ | - _

- Ordinance #07-08
E JUne?,_QOfC_)_?_- o

S -'. Exceptron No 1 to (6) and (7) Receptac!es that are noti -
L __readr!y accessrb!e " :

o Exceptron No 2 to (6)ano' (7) A smgle receptac!e ora:

" duplex receptacle for two appliances dedicated” for -

- each appliance that, in normal use; is riot easily moved. .
" from one place to another and that is cord-and plug-

connected in accordance wrth 400 7(A)(6) (A)(?) or L

- (A)(8).
(8) Boathouses
(9) Indoors: - - '
(a) Damp locatlons
" (b) Wet locations

Exceptron No. 1 to (9) Recepfacies thaf are not readrly‘_ j' . o :

access.'ble o

e Exceptron No 2 o (9) A smg!e reoeptacle ora dup!ex'_ g

. receptacle: for two appliances dedicated - for each .

- appliance that, in ‘normal use, is not eas:!y moved from -
' one place 1o another and that is cord-and’ plug-

- '__':connected in acoordance w.'fh 400 7(A)(6) (A)(?) or
A Ee o

(10) Boat Horsts Ground fau!t crrourt-lnterruptor protectron for-

~ personnel shall be provided for outlets that supply boat -

- hoists installed in dwelling, unit locations and supphed by_
- 125-volt 5- and 20 ampere branoh crrcurts

250.118. Typee of Equrpment Groundlng Conductors The‘ |
S equipment grounding conductor run with or enclosing the crrouut.
: _c_onductors shall be one or more or a combination of the following:

(1) A copper, aluminum or copper-clad aluminum conductor.
- This " conductor shall be solid or siranded; insulated,

covered or bare and in the form of a wnre or a busbar of "

o, - any shape, - : '

- {2) Rigid metal ‘conduit -

oo+ {3) Intermediate metal condurt : L -
(4) Electrical metallic tubrng wath an add:tlonal equupment '
. grounding conducior ©
- (5) Listed flexible metal conduit wrth an addltlona! equnpment' _

grounding conductor and meetlng ail of the followmg- S

B conditions: =~ |
a, The condunt |s termmated in f!ttlngs lrsted for.l-. _
~ grounding : -

26



b, The oomblned !ength of flexnble metal conduitand

liquidtight. flexible metal conduit in” the ground

return path ‘does -not exceed. 1.8m (6 ﬁ) for

_feeders and 15m (50 ft.) for branch circuits:

(6) Llsted liquidtight ﬂexuble metal oondust meetmg all of t.h.e"j ) ;

followmg conditions: -
- (No changes)-. ' el o
L (7) Listed liquidtight ﬂemble metal condu:t wrth an add!tlonaly-:.- e

' equipment groundlng conductor and meetmg all of the_

) follownng conditions: -

o - a _The condurt is iermlnated ln flttmgs llsted for

S groundlng
b:.- The comblned Iength of llqwdtlght flexnble metal

. - conduit ‘and flexible metal conduit in the same - - ' ..
ground return path does not exceed 15m (Boft)y .

a - for branch circuits and 1.5m {6 ft.) for feeders.:

o c The additional equipment grounding conductor is B

 terminated at each termination or junction point.

(8) Flexible metallic tubing where the tubing is terminated in '_ |
fittings listed for groundmg and meetlng the followmg

_ oond;tlons .
A a .The cwowt conductors contarned in the 'rubmg are’

o less. - -
- b The combmed Iength of flexuble metalllc condwt':-'
. and flexible metallic tubing and liquidtight flexible’
© metal conduit in the same ground return path does -

" not exceed 1.8m (6 fi.). L '

 protected by overcurrent devices rated at 20A or’_'.. S

(9) Armor of. Type AC cable with an add;tlonal equupment' S

groundmg conductor and as prowded in 320.108."

- { 0) The copper sheath of mmeral-:nsulated metal sheathed S

.. ‘cable:
- 1) Type MC cable where hsted and rdentified for groundlng ;
- accordance wnth the followmg _
(No changes) '

'_"'_(12) Cable trays, as perrhltted ln Sectlons 392 3(C) and”"_. =

392.7.
{(13) Cablebus framework as perm!tted in Section 370. 3
(14) Other listed electrically contmuous metal raceways and-
- listed auxiliary gutters. o
(15) Surface metal raceways llsted for ground:ng

2 Chapter 3 WIRING METHODS AND MATERIALS

a. 312. 5, delete the ’fext of the seo’uon and replace wrrh the followmg o
Ianguage L : . i

© Ordinance #07-08 . . .~ 27
o dune7, 2007 ) o Lo



Ordinance #07-08

© Jdune 7, 2007

| 312 5 ' “Cablnets Cutout Boxes and Meter Socket Enclosures
- Conductors entering enclosures within the scope of this ariicle
shall be protected froz_n abrasron and shali comply wrth 312 5'- .

o '.(A) through (C) "o

“Except:on For one- and two family dwelllngs cables'. o

- with entlrely non- metaliic sheaths shall be permitied to _
. enter the back of a surface mounted enclosure through

" “one or'more non-flexible raceways not more than 75 mm
-~ {8inyin diameter, and not less than 75 mim (3 in.) and

:.{ - not more than 600 mm (24 1n) in length provrded ait of-'-::._- o

- S _:the followmg condltions are met

§ a Each cable is fastened W|th|n 200 mm (8 ln), |
;*"measured along the sheath ot the outer end ot the_

© raceway.

5 b.,-' _The raceway extends dlrectly in to an enclosed wall S

- space.’

c A f|tt|ng is prov:ded on each end of the raceway to e

" protect the cabte(s) from abrasion..

d. The raoeway is sealed or plugged us:ng approved._"'_';_;-_"__.'
.. means so as to prevent access to the enolosuref' PR

i through the raceway. -

s e.' The cable sheath is contlnuous through ihe raceway:"_l-'_.: o
- and extends lnto the enolosure beyond the ﬂttlng not- L

- less than 50 mm (2 in.)."

t - The raceway, if greater than 12 lnches (300 mm) :s'._. |
. fastened at its outer end in accordance wuth the

3 ' __applicable artlole

o f._f;g,-. ‘The raceway shall be l:)ermttted to be filled o 60'_'-" o
Co percent of. its tolal  cross-sectional area,  and
- 310. 15(2)(&1) ad}ustment factors need not apply to th‘S.'. o

a .'_"-'condrtlon

b 334 10 delete the text ot the seotlon and replaoe W|th the fotlow:ng '. L :

language : Fo

-.334.10. “Uses Permrtted Type NM Type NMC and Type NMS o
cables shall be permitted to be used in the foliownng o

* i .~ One- and two- family dwellings - -~ a .
ii'-.. : Multlfarnlly dwellings permrtted to be of Types III lV

- and V construction -

' Other dwelling unit accessory burldlngs_and struotures- .

:' in accordance wrth 334. 10 (1) and (2)



F.PN' | N__'o.1': ‘Types: of building ;_.__Coﬁst_rUCtion. and . .
- oceupancy. classification -in. NFPA 220-1999,
Standard on Types of Buddmg Ccnstructzon or the o

applicable building code, or both. -

'FPN No. 2! See Annex E for determlnatlon of

- building types [NFPA 220, Table 3-1].

- N Cabie trays in structures permitted to be TYpes m IV"-'- R

" and Voor where the cables are rdentrfled for the use.- |

. FPN:. See 31010 for temperature i:mrtatlon of'_-__ .'

o _oonductors

:'(A)Type NM Type NM cable shall be permltted as R

foliows

* “normally dry locations -

~ {2) To be installed or flshe_d in air vords ln masonry']

block or tile walls. -

o - '(B)Type NMC Type NMC cable shall be perml’rted as o

fol!ows

) For bolh exposed and concealed work in dry'

moist, damp, or corrosive locations. -

(1)For both exposed and concealed work |n '

(2) in |nS|de ancl outsrde walls of masonfy 'block or'.';"'-.f'

trle

(3) In a shallow chase in masonry,_concrete or
.. adobe protected against nails or screws by a- - .
. ‘steel plate at least 1.59 mm (1/16”) thick and. :

covered with plaster, adobe, or similar finish. -

o (C)Ty'pe NMS. Type NMS cable shall be perrnltted as’

follows

(1)For bot'h exposed and concealed work |n-':_.

-normally dry locations .

('2) To beinstalled or fished in air vords in masonry'.'_'

block or tzle walls

c. 334. 12 replace the text of the sectton wrth the followmg ianguage
334 12 “Uses not permitted.

(A)Types NM, NMC, and Nms Types NM, NMC, and.-__.f'-f_' o

- NMS cables shall not be used as follows: -

(1) In” any dwelling or struciure not specnflcally

permitted in 334.10(1), (2), and (3} -
{2} As service-entrance cables _
- {8) in hoistways or on elevators or ‘escalators

(4) Embedded in poured cement, concrete, or o

_ aggregate g

 Ordinance #6708 .. .. - . 29
June 7, 2007 . ' : .




d 12022 delete

(B) Types NM and NMS Types NM and NMS cables.
- shall not be used under the followmg condltlons or in
* the following locations: - . . -

{1) Where exposed to corroswe fumes or vapors

- (2) Where = embedded - in masonry, concrete_:- B

. adobe, fill, or plaster :
{3} In_ a shallow chase in masonry, concrete or

. adobe and covered wuth piaster adobe or.
. similar finish. B '

" (4) Where exposed or subject tc excesswer_-'
o morsture or dampness v 2 i o

Sect|on 6 The Internatlonal Mechamcal Code 2006 amendments are adopted as -

follows

Ordinance #O?_—OB .
. June?, 2007 o

Chaptert ADM!NISTRATION
| a 1011 lnsert the words “Clty of Surprise” as the name cf
le’lSdtCtlon IR R T : ; '

106 4 3 delete the text of the sectlon and replace wrth the fotlowmgl o

. Ianguage “Every permit issued’ shall become invaiid uniess the - B
- work authonzed by such permit is: commenced and’ reqwred;-_.*-f._ o
;nspectlon(s) are requested by the permlttee and approved by the. -

Building Official within 90 days after its issuance, or if more than

180 days elapses between approval of requrred mspectlon(s) "The " .
~Building Official shall be authorized to grant one extension of time R '
 for a period not to exceed 180 days. Permits shall not be extended
 more than once and all requests for extension shall be in wntlng" o
- prior. to the explratlon of the permlt and justifiable cause '
" demonstrated ~ In"order. to. renew action on a permit after -
_expiration, a new full permit fee shall be paid based on the current -

fee schedule adopted by the Crty, except as apprcved by the .

L Bua!ding Off|C|aI ol




Ordinance #07-08 -

© WJune 7, 2007 - -

| d 106 4, 4 delete the text of the sectlon and replace W|th the followrng o )

language: “An application for a permit for any proposed work shall -

. be deemed to have been abandoned 30 days after the date of . o
issuance nofification, unless such application has been pursued in. .o

good faith or a permit has been issued; except that the Building -

- Official is authorized to grant one extension of time for an addmonal-._' _
.+ period of 30 days The extension shall be requested in writing pnor R
~ to the expiration of the appllcatlon and justifiable cause: ' SR

demonstrated. To reinstate an application after explratlon a full S

" new plan review fee shall be assessed except as approved by the :
_Buuldlng Ottlclal . SR SEEEE

. 106 5 2 delete the text of the sectlon and replace wuth the follcwmg'?

language “A fee for each permrt shall be paid as required; in

_accordance with. the schedule as establlshed by the Crty of_-__l---' .
Surprlse ' : LT e

S 106 5. 3 delete the fext of the sectlon and replace wuth the followmg -
" language:. “The Building Official shall be permitted to authorize .
~ refunding of a fee paid hereunder which was erroneously paid or .
- collected.. The Building Official shall be permitied to authorize -
- refunding ‘of not more than 80 percent of the permit fee paid when -
.- no work has been done under a permit issued in accordance with . -
- this code..- The Building Official shall be permitted to authorize ...~
~refunding of not more than 80 percent of the plan review fee paid -
- when an application for a pen’mt for which a plan review fee has .~
- been paid is withdrawn or canceled before any examination time

has been expended. The Building Official shall riot be permitted to.- . -

o authorize refunding of any fee paid except upon written application _' R
~ filed by the orlglnal permlttee not later than 180 after the date offee - =

payment

' 108 4- delete :

.- 108.5, delete the last sentence and replace w:th the followung S

- language: “Any person who shall continue’ any work on the system =~ = -
* after having been served by a stop work order, except such work

as that person is directed to perform to remove a violation or -
unsafe condition, shall be Ilable fora flne as establlshed by the Crty o

cf Surpnse e

109 delete

2 Chapter2 DEFINITIONS

81



a 201 4, delete the text of the sectlon and replace w:th the followrng I
- language: - “Where terms are not defined through the methods .- -
L ___:_.authorlzed by this chapter, such terms shall have ordinarily
.. accepted meanings such as the context implies. Websters Third 3
- New Internationai Dictionary of the English Language, Unabndged S

L '.- shall be constdered as prowdlng ordlnarlly accepted meamngs SR O _.

o 3 Chapters GENERAL REGULATIONS

. 304.3, delete the text of the section and repiace wuth the fellowmg:_.__' R
: language; . “Equipment and appliances having an lgnmon source. .
- and Iocated in" hazardous. locations' and public garages, private - =
garages repalr garages automotive. setvices stafions and parkmg*_: S
..+ . “garages shall be elevated such that the source of lgn:tlon isnot“-
-+ less than 18 inches {457 mm) above the floor surface on which the - ..~ -~
;_’.-'f'equ;pment or apphance rests. Such eqmpment and’ applrances‘%_'_’
. shall.not be installed in Group H occupancies or control areas .
cl _where open use, handllng or dlspensmg of combustible, flammable---";'_ T
- or explosive’ materials’ cccurs::. For the purpose of this section, =~ "
"~ rooms or spaces that are not part of the living space of d dwelling. .-
~ unit ‘and that communicate directly with a private garage through "~ - -

o opemngs shall be censmlered to be part of the prlvate garage o

Exceptlen “Clethes dryers lnstalled ln pnvate garages

e a 901 5 (new) add the fellowmg sectlon

" Ordinance #07-08 . _
- June7,2007 0 .

9015 Flreplace and Weod Steve Prchlbmon Allzf:replacezs' and
- solid fuel-burning appllances including conversions or alterat:ons S
- are prohlblted unless it conforms to one of the fo!lowsng e

| 1. A f:replace that has a permanently ""Sta“ed gas or electrlc_ B

Iog msert

”2';"'.A flreplace or solld fuel burmng appllance that the Buuldmg |

- Ofﬁma! determines is used selely fcr
o a) cooking; ' S :
"~ b) heating;
- ¢) outdoor use; or. -
'd) mdustnal use.

3 A flreplace a wocd stove or any ether solzd fuel burnlng S

. _._applrance that Is any of the follewmg

32 ..

4 Chapterg SPECIFIC APPLIANCES FlREPLACES AND soue FUEL-.'—".-' T
- BURNING EQIPMENT - | RS



a) Certlfled by the Umted States enwrcnmental".- L
.. protection agency as in compliance with 40 Code - - -
.- of Federal Regulations part 60 subpart AAA in- .
~ . effect on July 1, 1980; . R
b) A wood stove tested and Ilsted by a natlonally-'
+ 'recognized testing. agency to meet performance: |
- standards equivalent to' those in 40 Code of " *
* Federal Regulatlons part 60 subpartAAA in effect: T
7o onJuly 1, 1990;
. ¢) Determined by, the county air quahty control otflcer'_’ Coch
- to meet performance standards equivalent to.; - -
R those in 40 Code of Federal Ftegulatlons part 60, - - -
o7 subpart AAA in effect on July. 1, 1990; or a oo
7. fireplace that has a permanently lnstatled wood . -
. stove lnsert that oomphes W|th 3 a) b) or c) of thls'--?_._,
seotlon FL s

Sectron 7 The lnternational P]umblng Code 2006 amendments are adopted as-" Felealoon
follows R - : SR L

T A -

Chapter 1 ADMINISTRATION

a 1011 msert the words"‘Clty of Surpnse” 'as the name Of_‘:.'...-'-_-_.'-_._:..:
.___lUr!Sdlctaon A U RIS RS

b 106.5.3 delete the text of the sec’ucn and replace wrth the tcl!owmg}s} EREEE
language “Every permit rssued shall become invalid uniess the . -
o work authonzed by such’ permit is ‘commenced and required. .
~ inspection(s) are requested by the permittee and approved bythe . .- -
Building Official within 90 days after its issuance, or if more than ..~
.. 180 days elapses between approval of requrred lnspectton(s) The .
" Building Official shall be authorized to grant one extension of time - .
- for a period not to exceed 180 days Permits shalt not be extended o
- more than once and all requests for extension shall be in writing. F
" In order to renew action on a permit after expiration, a new full -
. permlt fee shall be paid based on the current fee schedule adopted o
by the Clty, exoept as approved by the Buﬂdlng Offrcrai . <

o o 1084 delete

d 1085 delete the last sentence and replace With the follcwmg o
- ianguage “Any person who shall continue any work on the system  ©
after havmg been served by a stop work order, except such work. =
‘as that person is directed to perform to remove a violation or
. unsafe oondlucn shalt be llable forafme as estabhehed by the City_= '
. ;.-'cf Surprlse S . R R

. Ordinance.#OT-OS"' o o _' - 33

- June7,2007 - -



' e 109 de!ete

R Chapter2 DEFINIT!ONS

Car 201 4 deiete the text of the section and replace with the followmg.- o
T Ianguage “Where terms are not deﬁned through the methods .
'authonzed by this chapter; such' terms shall have ordlnar:ly--"_.'_
N accepted meanings such as the context implies. Webster's Third =
- New International Dictionary of the English Language Unabndged: I
"'shali be cons:dered as prowdmg crdmarlly accepted meanrngs e D

o 3. "__-Chapter 4 FIXTURES FAUCETS AND FIXTURE FITTINGS

_!a 4101 Dnnklng Fountalns delete the !ast sentence and replace-';:-:_-f"- R
- with the following language “In other occupancies, where drinking .
fountalns are. requ:red bottle water dlspensers or water coolers__ L

shall be permitted to be substituted n

4 Chapter 6, WATER SUPPLY AND DISTHIBUTION

S a 604 8 delete the text of the sectlon and replace wnth the followmg_: Sl
"+ language:. “An approved water-pressure reducing valve conforming- .. ..
. to ASSE 1003 with' strainer shall be instalied to reduce the .. -~
" pressure in the bwldmg water dlstnbutlon piping to 80 pSl (552 kPa). o

R statlc cr Iess (Retaln Exceptlon and Subsectlons )”
5. Chapter12 SPECIAL PIP!NG AND STORAGE SYSTEMS N L
a. 1202 Medlcal Gases Addanew sectlon as fo!lows

12021 1 Level 3 Dental Facrhtles Vacuum plplng mstalied-.i'

" under an on-grade floor shall be installed in oompl:ance with -

- recommendations. and drawings prepared by a. registered

" design professional and contained within the dental equipment
manufacturer’s speclfrcatlons and details, and with- the, - .

. otherwise applicable provisions of NFPA 99C — 2005. All
- drawings and specifications shall be sufficiently comprehenswe_

. as to provide prescriptive installation criteria. Special snspectlon
N accordance wrth IBC Section 1704 1 shall be provrded

Sectron 8. The lnternational Fuei Gas Code 2006 amendments are adopted as
follows: - . : - . : : . '

1. Cha'p{er 1, AD'MINISTRATION

' Ordinance #07-08 . a4
_ June 7, 2007 C- B o



a 1011 lnsert the words"‘Clty of Surprlse”'as the name of:__"._

- Jurisdiction.
o b. 106.4. 3, delete the text of the section and replace Wlth the followmg :

Ianguage “Every permit issued shall become invalid unless the "

work  authorized by such permit is commenced and required

_ .mspectlon(s) are requested by the permitiee and approved by the__'--”--_ : _
- Building Official within' 90 days after its issuance, or if more than B

180 days elapses between approval of required lnspection(s) The-

. Building Gificial shall be authorized to grant one extension of time .~ -
" for a period not to exceed 180 days. Permits shall not be exiended . = . .
“'more than once and all requests for extension shall be in writing."~ - - 7.
~In order to renew action on a permit after . expxration a new full - = -
-~ permit fee shall be pald based on the current fee schedule adopted o
. by the City, except as approved by the Bu:ldlng Offlmal Mo s

e c. _108 4 delete

d. 1085 delete the last sentence and replace wuth the fo!lowmg'-.__-

- language:- “Any person who shall continue any work on the system
. after hawng been served by a stop work order, except such work . -
" as that person is directed to ‘perform to.remove a violation or -~ -
- unsafe condlt:on shall be hable for a flne as establlshed by the Clty:

= - of Su rprlse
o e 109 delete

2 Chapter 2, DEFINITIONS'*-

B a 201. 4 delete the text of the sect:on and replace wrth the followzng R |
' language:  “Where terms’ are not defined through the methods .
authorized by this -chapter, such terms shall have ordinarily

- accepted meanings such as the contexi implies. Webster's Third -

- New International chtlonary of the English Language, Unabrldged

' shall be consadered as prowding ordlnanly accepted meanlngs

Section 9. The lntematlonal Energy Conservatton Code 2006 amendments are-

o adopted as fotlows | |
' 1. Chapter1 ADMINISTRATION

a 1011 insert the words “Clty of Surpnse” as the name of
jurlsdlctlon : o _ _ _

Sectlon 10 The Internatlonal Property Malntenance Code 2006 amendments are"'

o adopted as follows

'.-'.-crdinance#w-oe -

© . June7,2007 . .



1 Chapter‘l ADMINiSTRATION

._'106 4 delete

1011 msert the words “Crty of Surprlse“' as the name of -

_ jurtsdtctlon

| 101 3 delete .the Iast sentence

.."102 3, delete _

102 4 delete the word "msanttan/" and replace wrth unsanltary. L
. _.103 2, delete the words “of thls jurtsdtctton | |

) 103 4 delete the words "whlle actlng for the Jurlsdlcﬁon

103 5 detete the text of the sectlon and replace wrth the follow:ngf

- language: "The fees for services and activities performed by the =~
department in carrylng out its responsibilities under this code shall -

be as prov:ded tn the adopted codes and fee scheduie of the. |

jurtsdlctlon

-__1 06. 5 delete “herein prescrrbed" after the word “penalttes ' Delete-'- R
legal officer” and replace with “Community Development Director, . -

" or his delegate.” Delete the words “of the jurtsdrctton“ after the
word ‘delegate.” : -

- 107 2 add the words "or premlse" aﬁer the word structure

107 5 add the words “or premlse aﬂer the word structure-

1095 delete the words “legal counsel of the ;urtsdtctlon“'and

o replace with “Communtty Development Dlrector or delegate

m.

1 10 4, delete

111 2 through 111 8 delete

| 2 Chap’terz Detrnrttons B

'_-__a

202, (new) add the followmg sectlon "Antmal Waste: Waste from

 stables, - kennels, pet pens, - chicken. coops, = veterinary

_'establlsh__r_nents and others of a SImllar nature and household pet' '

o waste.”

Ordinance #07-08

- June 7, 2007



. Ordinance #07-08
- . June 7,2007

b 202 (new) add the followmg sectlon "Attractlve Nwsance A
condztlon mstrumentalrty machine or other agency which is
__ 'dangerou_s and Wthh may reasonably be expected to attract any.‘-’:'_;._
person . o . . -

. -202 (new) add the followmg sec’non “Automotwe FIu;d Gasohne S o
. diesel fuel, and any other motor fuel 01! grease antlfreeze or_ \_
-'_transmxssu)n flurd” B . L -

202 (new) add the followmg sectlon “Bllght or Bllghted Unsrghtly-'_- S
____""_condltrons “of: a building, - structure, accessory bmldtng fence, - 7 -
- landscaping or’ property- characterrzed by neglect; lack. of

. maintenance, damage or any other similar conditions of disrepair, -~ - -

.- ‘or deterioration. . Examples include but are not limited to the ;" -
" accumulation of debris, wood; scrap iron or other metal, boxes -

. paper, vehicle paits, tires, znoperable equ1pment or vehicles, -
. discarded appliances or any items that may harbor insect or vermin.

_infestation or create a fire hazard; Iandscap:ng that is overgrown, =~ -

dead or damaged; fences that are broken, rotted, damaged or

leaning;: buildings or structures exhibltlng general disrepair or .

.- dilapidation mcludlng but not. limited to deteriorated. shingles, -
. peeling paint, broken doors or wmdows or any other e\ndence of
o neglect or Iack of ma:ntenance ' N L

202 (new) add the fcllcwrng sectlon "Debns Substance or_' T
“material of litle or no apparent vaiue lnclud:ng but not Limited to -~ -
. deteriorated lumber, old newspapers, cardboard matenal scrap .
~ metal, vehicle parts, discarded fumiture' parts, stoves sinks, - =
. _cablnets household fixtures, refrlgerators broken or neglected o
| _'eCIUipment or the scattered remalns of |tems ' : o

202 (new) add the followmg sectlon “Deterioratlon The lowerlng | o
of quality of the condition of a burldlng, structure or parts thereof

including. but not limited to holes, breaks rot, crumblmg, cracking,

- peeling, rusting or any other ewdence of physrcal decay or neglect o
~or rlack of malntenance o ) B .

. 202 (new) add the fotlcwmg sectlcn "Vehlcle Every devrce by -
~ which any person of property is or may be transported or drawn,
including but not limited to automobiles, motor homes, fravel =
~ trailers, utility trailers, or watercraft. Devices moved by human .
.. power or ‘used exclusrvely upon statlonary ralls or tracks are

- exempt : : : :

37



h

202 (new) add the foliowrng sectlon “Yard Sa!e Means and -

_ includes garage sales, carport sales or similar types of sales on the - _
. seller's own premises, involving the sale of used or second hand .. B
. tangible pereonal propetty customarlly found in and about the =
- residence, and not lncludrng property acqurred for resale and not. .
Ll for personal use . SR _ .

3 Chapter 3 GENERAL REQU!REMENTS

Ordmance #07 08

o June? 200? i

3021 add the foi!owmg sentence . ”No person shall al[ow the Gee L

'aecumu!atlon of items such as, but not limited to, botties, glass, .

~cans, pieces of scrap wood, metal, metal articles, paper, plastic, R

- boxes, tires, vehicle parts or other such materlals or 1tems |n S
: -_'__unshettered areas of prxvate property Gl el e

302 1 1 delete paragraph sect:on 302, 1 1 and replace wrth 302 25
“add the following section: . "ltems in Public View. No person shall
~ place and/or store furniture, except fumiture designed and placed * -
for outdoor use, household equrpment applrances constructlon or - .- _
~landscape material, debrls or any S|mllar rnateriais that cause a" L
: bllghted condltlon B e e e s

302 4 Weede lnsert the number "6 lnches“ where mdtcated
302 4 1 deiete paragraph sectlon 302 4 1 and replace W|th 302 17 e

~ add the following section: "Trees, Shrubs and Plants. No owner or'.___' S
. occupant of any property shall allow or permit any trees, shrubs, or .~

other plant growth on the property to impede, obstruct or interfere -

. with the free passage upon any public street, sidewalk or alleyway;

- or obstruct the visibility of drivers; or interfere with any traffic control

o device, sign or street lighting. Tree limbs must be maintained to
hang no lower than thirteen (13) feet above any public street or® *
" alleyway and seven (7) feet above any publlc sidewalk. Trees

below eight (8) feet, shrubs or other plant growth must be'.";

' marntamed clear from any publrc srdewalk R
3025 delete o

302 8 Add the follow:ng sentence 6 the exceptten "'SLICh vehicles - -
*_can be stored in a carport if the vehicle is covered with a properly

~ maintained vehicle cover made exclusively for covering vehicles."



g 302 8. 1 delete paragraph section 302 8 1 and reptace With 302. 16
- add the followrng section: "Vehicles for Sale. No person shall park =

or permit to be parked any vehicle for the purpose of sale upon any.

~ property or vacant property except where the sale of a vehicle is o
) customary and mmdental to the princrpal use of the property TR

. 302 8 2 delete paragraph sectron 302.8. 2 and repiace wath 302 15 e
" add the following" section: ~ "Display Vehicles for Sale from’ o
e Residence. The d:splay of one (1) vehicle for sale is permrtted ata
o _reS|dence when the vehicle is titled to the owner or occupant ofthe .
. ' property, is parked on an improved parking surface and is not being - "
.. sold in connection with an automobile sales business.” No more ™"
- than three (3) vehicles may be dlsplayed for sale at the same -
S res;dence within a twelve {12) month period; and oniy one vehlcle:' o
o may be dlsplayed for sale at one (1) tlme " '- ERRRI L S

i. - 302 8. 3 delete paragraph sectlon 302 8 3 and replace wrth 302. 11 R
-~ add the following section:-. "Vehicle F{epalrs within Any Ressdentlal-.-_-. -
-+ Zoned District. Any vehicle undergomg repalr must be titled to the e
owner or occupant ot the property v L C

T 302 9, delete

* Ordinance #07-08 -
June 7,2007 . -

k. _30210 add the followmg sectron "Anlmal Droppmgs/Waste R
7. Animal waste such as, but not limited to, manure and droppings ..
-+ 'shall be removed from kennels, pens, stables, vyards and other ..

. enclosures at least twice weekly and from the property at least

 once each week, or more frequently if conditions so necessitate.": "

1 302.12, (new) add the tollowmg section; “Parkmg Surtaces S
-~ Vehicles must be parked upon a surface whlch is :mproved for .

L parklng by concrete asphalt graveI or other s:mrtar means o '

: 302 13 (new) add the followmg section “Open Holes Any hote -
-+ well, excavation, pit cistern, septic tank or ditch which is not

L guarded at all times must be covered by a securely locked covering
~ which is capable at its weakest point, of bearing a minimum weight -
“of four hundred pounds without collapse, or shall be fully covered

by one or more plates of steel with a thickness of not less than one-.

- half inch, or reinforced concrete of similar strength, each of which
- plates or ‘covers shall weigh not less than two hundred pounds.
The provisions of this code shall not apply to smmmmg poo!s
spas, stock tanks dramage or lrngatlon dltches o S

39



Ordinance #07-08 -
June 7, 2097 S

. 302 14, (new) add the foltowrng sectron “Noxious Odors. : The TR
- emission of noxious odors and other’ noxious exhalations, -

N rncludrng, but not Irmrted to smoke soot dust fumes or other S
S gases |s prohlbrted ”? . B . - .

0. '302 18 (new) add the followrng sectron “Constructlon Equment _'
- . The storing or Ieavrng of any constructron or farm machinery or .
- equrpment in public view rs_proh:brted except where permltted by"} e

the crty zonrng regulatlon

. 302 19 (new) add the foilowrng sectron “Clothes L|ne No person‘_\-;‘? R

. shall place or hang any rag, towel, beddrng, clothing or any other .. - . .
... similar item on a.fence, tree, rope, or other object which is not~ "~ - & -

S ;j"deS|gned constructed and used for the soIe purpose of hangrng_.f R
- clothes” : R o L

'g:. 302.20, (new) add the follow:ng sectron “Obstructlon Emergencyi;-;_-ﬁ o
-~ Access. .~ Any condition. which could. hamper or obstruct the. . -

..~ passage of police, paramedrc ambulance, fire fighting or other = -
-~ public safety functions, into, out of or within the vicinity of any. = . -
: burldlng or structure capable of belng occupred by humans |s:i'. IR

.. '302 21 (new) add the fotlowrng seotron ' “Abandonment or“'_.__ R
. Placement on Another's Property No person shall cause, allow, -~
- suffer or permit personal property ‘which he owns, leases rents or -

.. conirols to be abandoned on a public. right-of-way, street, alley or._'.___j
- hlghway, or on any pubhc oF pnvate reaI property wrthrn the C|ty U

302 22 (new) add the fol!owmg seotron Yard Sales Yard sa!es L
. are permitted for no more than three (3) events per calendar year
" and can last seventy—two (72) hours or less at the same resrdence T
or street address R : _ e 3 :

. 302 23 (new) add the tollowrng section “Stagnant Water All_ .
Lo property shall be ‘maintained to prevent the accumulation of L
- stagnant water that may cause a hazardous or unhealthy oondrtron'

- or breed rnsects ' - : :

w0



- aa.,

..302.24; (new) add the following section; “Automotive Liquids. - .

- Every owrer or occupant who controls or has the right to control - :

_ “any property in the c;ty shall keep and maintain the properiy free of =
~  automotive. liquids -unless the liquids are stored or used in a. ~ =

manner which does not contribute to blight and are limited toa

" quantity which is reasonable for a lawful activity conducted on the © =~~~

“property. Disposal of automotive liquids into storm dralns on any-_'-_-f' EIER

' property orin any trash contarners is prohlblted SR o

. 303 1, delete the words "Smmmmg pools shall be marntained ln a

- clean and samtary condition, and in good repair' and replace with - e
“"No person shall allow any swimming pool, architectural pool, pond e

" or spa to remain or be maintained in a condition that may breed -~ " "
. insects or result in insect or other infestation, is polluted or .. R
_stagnant or creates a bllght!ng conditlon " : L

"3044 deiete
3045 delete o

304 6 delete

. 304.1, delete the text of thls sectlon and replace wrth the followmg AT

- "All exterior surfaces of any buildings or structures including but not = -

* limited to fences walls, or roofs, or appurtenances including butnot ..

. fimited. - windows, wmdow frames “window . - screens, .
~doors, 'door frames canOptes _awnings, . comices, porches, . . -
stamrrays ralllngs or s;mtlar items shall be properly maintained and - ..
- shall not othervvlse present a bllghted oF detenorated appearance SR

.304 7, add “roof covenngs shall be substantlally free from broken -
- rotted, split or curled materials and shall not otherwise present a-

. deteriorated or blighted appearance. All materials shall be uniform,

 bb.
: _I_'cc

sentence

304.14. delete e

-307.1. add the follow:ng at the end of the sentence E discarded”
construction - matenals and/or construction- waste when such -

conditions create a blighting condition, or may harbor infestations

. :or are Ilkely to become a hazard to the pubhc health or safety "

dd 307 2, add the words "and garbage" after the words. “dlspose of all _

' rubbish v

- :_f__'j-'-:'_.'_ee 307 2, 1 delete

" Ordinance #07-08 -
S June7,2007 0 .

41

_compatzble and con3|stent wrth the desngn thereof " after the last



. g.307.3.1, delete numbers “307.3.1" and replace with “307. e add.. R
R the words or occupant“ afterthe words "the owner. SR

.hh 308 1 add the words' “and exterror property“ after the words "AII _:. ST
. Struotures o . Lo

ff 3073 add the followmg sentence "DISposal of garbage and_f--

- rubbish” before the sentence “No person shall place any waste .. -
‘materials, trash, weeds or other accumulation of debris upon any - :
public or prlvate property not owned or under the control of suoh_ R

o person

i Addanew Sectlon 309, DANGEROUS BUILDINGS” B

Ordinance #07-08
L. June7,2007 .-

1.' _
. structure or equipment which has any or all of the conditons of =~ .~ '+~
. defects hereafter described shall be deemed to be a dangerous ~* = =
- building, provided that such conditions or defects exist to the .
extent that the life, health, property or safety of the publlc or |ts S
' occupants |s endangered T T S

309 (new) add the foliowmg sectlon "Generai Any burldlng,_'-'

y 309. 1 (new) add the fo!lowmg sectron “Structurally Unsound or'_:'_ S

Abandoned - Whenever any. bur!dlng or structure which is

partially destroyed structurally unsound, left in _a state of partlal

constructlon or abandoned is prohlblted o

-309 2, (new) add the followmg sectlon “Egress Whenever any o
__ bwldlng or structure which has any or all of the conditions of .~
defects any door, aisle, passageway, stalrway or other means .~

of exit is not of sufficient width or size or is not so arranged as

| _ _to provude safe and adequate means of exit in case of flre or .

3093 (new) add the followrng sectlon “Walklng Surfaces.

-, Whenever the walking surface of any aisle, passageway, .
. stairway or other means of exit is so warped, worn, loose, tormn . -

.- or otherwise unsafe as to not prowde safe and adequate means
: of exrt in case of flre or pamo . : '



Ordinance #67-08 *

© o June 7, 2007 -

burldmgs of srmrlar structure purpose or Iocatron

309 5 (new) add the followrng sectron' “Fallure of Member or -

'Appurtenance " Whenever any portion or member or -
- appurtenance thereof is likely to fail, or to become detached or -

dislodged or to collapse and thereby |njure persons or damage,_ '

' property

3096 (new) add the followmg sectron “Anchorage of-': :

' Appurtenances or Ornamentatlon Whenever any portion of a -~

~building, or any member, appurtenance or ornamentation on the;;-' S

- exterior thereof is_not of sufficient strength or stability, or is:not 7. - "

so anchored, ‘attached or fastened in place so as to be capable__

- of resrstmg a wind pressure of on half of that specified in the . - RS

~ building code for new buildings of similar structure, purpose or. -
location without exceedmg the workrng stress permltted 1n the S

'.'burldlng code for such burldrngs " S R

v "309 7 (new) add the fotlowrng sectlon “Resrstance to Wlnds or '_ -

Earthquakes -~ Whenever - any portion thereof has wracked
buckied or settled to such an extent that walls or other structural .

'portrons have matenal[y less resistance to winds or earthquakes _. _'
than is requrred in the case ot srmrlar new constructron :

3098 (new) add the followmg sectlon “Partlal or Complete S
Collapse. Whenever the burlding or structure or any portlon' -

thersof, because of:.

" a. Dilapidation, deterloration or decay, o e

b: Faulty construction,”

~ ¢. The removal, movement or rnstabrllty ot any portlon of the

~ground necessary for the purpose of support:ng such"'

building,

' d. The deterloratlon. decay or rnadequacy ot Its foundatlon or

L e Any other cause, is likely to partially or completely collapse ”

309.9, (new) add the following section, “Failure of Exterior Walls '
or Vertical Members.. Whenever the exterior walis or other
vertical structural members Ilst lean or buckle to such an extent

~ that a plumb line passing through the center of gravity does not

L fall msrde the rnrddle one—thlrd of the base "

43

309.4, (new). add the foliowing section, “Compromised =
Structural Strength. Whenever any portion thereof has been -
damaged by fire, earthquake, wind, flood or by any other cause,.”
to such an extent that the structural sirength or stability thereof
s materrally less than it was before such catastrophe and is less. -

“than the minimum requ:rements of the building code for new



e

o 1.1-‘..

~“structure. has been consiructed, exists or is maintained in |
. violation of any specific requirement or prohibition applicable to =~ - -
. such building or structure provided by the building regulations of

309.10, '('nevtt)" add the following section. “Construction” or
Maintenance of Building Violations. Whenever any building or

. the Clty of Surprise, as specified in the building code or of any =

o _law or ordinance of this staf_e relatlng to the condltlon tocatron‘ '-
- ;._._or Structure of buﬂdnngs T S

309 11 (new) add the followung sectlon' “Unsamtary Buﬂdlng or S
e Structure Whenever a building or structure, used or infended - -
- to be used for dwelling purposes,. because  of tnadequate
. maintenance, dilapidation, decay, damage, faulty construction. ~ -
oo arrangement inadequate light, air or sanitation facilities, or - -

 otherwise, is determined by the code’ OfftCtal to be unsanltary, P

unfit for human habitation or in such a condntlon that is hkety to

o cause smkness or dtsease

309 12 (new) add the followmg sect!on “Flre Hazard SR
SRR Whenever any bunldmg or structure, because of obsolescence, .
.. dilapidation condition, deterioration, damage, inadequate exits, . .

" lack of sufficient fire-resistive construotlon faulty electiic wire, .= -

. 'gas connections or. heatlng apparatus “or ‘other cause, is -

_determmed by the code offtmal to be a ﬁre hazard T

30913 (new) add h. followung sectlon .- “Bu;ldlng"-'

Abandonment/Fa:lure to Remove Demohtlon Debris. Whenever .-

~any. portion ‘of a building or structure remains on a site after the

. : demolition or destruction’ of the building or structure. or .

- whenever any bunldlng or structure is abandoned for a penod in

. excess of six months so as to constitute such building or porttion
N '__'_thereof an attractlve nu:sanoe or hazard fo the pubhc P

Sectlon 11 The tnternatlonal Exust:ng Bu:!d!ng Code 2006 amendments are adopted' |

. ‘as follows

Ordinance #07-08 . -

. J_une 7,2007

1 Chaptert Admmtstrat;on

'a 1011 msert the words “City ot Surprtse as the name of
: junsdtctlon ' . : _ o

b. .101 2 insert the words “when approved by the Bu:tding Offtcuat” at
o | the end of the sentenoe =

112 Means of Appeal delete in |ts ent:rety

s



.Sect:on 12 The Internatlonal Flre Code 2006 is hereby amended as follows

= 'The followzng appendlces of the Intematlonal Fire Code 2006 Edttlon are hereby

: | adopted in their entirety

Appendlx B F |re-Flow Requrrements for Buﬂdmgs

- Appendix C - Fire Hydrant Location and Dlstrlbutlon

* Appendix D - Fire Apparatus Access Roads R

© Appendix E - Hazard Categories I

* Appendix F - Hazard Ranking - L TR
_ Appendlx G Cryogenlc Flunds Welght and Volume Equwalents

“ o oo sr..m'

_'The lntematronal Frre Code 2006 Edltlon is hereby amended as follows L

"""_':The followmg Appendlces of the tntematlonal Fire Code 2006 Edltlon are hereby
adopted in the|r ent|rety o S S _

Appendlx B Flre-Flow Ftequ:rements for Buﬂdlngs
- Appendix C - Fire Hydrant Location and Distrlbutlon
. Appendix D - Fire Apparatus Access Roads :
Appendix E - . Hazard Categones S

; Appendrx F Hazard Rankmg

_:.m:e-,o = e-.

k '_ Appendlx G Cryogen:c Flurds Werght and Volume Equwalents S

Chapter"! ADMINISTRATION

Sectlon 101 1 delete and replace wrth the fo!lowmglanguage

'101 1 Tltle ThIS code shall be known as the City of Surp_nse Frre Code and may be I

- cited as such and will be referred to herein as “this code.”

S Sec’uon 102 3 delete and replace wuth the followmg languag'e

. 1023 Change of use or occupancy No change shall be made in the use orl-g |

‘occupancy of any structure that would place the structure in a dlfferent division of the. . B

‘same group or occupancy or in a different group of ‘occupancies, unless made 1o

E ~ comply with the requirements of this code and the international building code. Subject . |

to the approval of the Fire Chief, the use or occupancy of an existing structure shallbe
- permitted to be changed and the structure ailowed o be ‘occupied for purposes in other

" groups without conforming to all the requlrements of this code and the international’ |

- building code for those groups, provided the new or proposed use is less hazardous,
~ based on life and fire risk, than the existing use. All changes of occupancy shall be -
‘ coordinated with the Fire Marshal prior to issuance of a temporary or permanent
 certtificate of occupancy All references to the Internatlonal E)ﬂstlng Bwldmg Code are

o hereby deleted. -

g Ordmance_#t)?OS ; _ T S 45
- June 7, 2007 - : : S -



B Sectlon 102 4 delete and reglace W|th the followmg language

102 4 Apphcatlon of bunldmg code The des:gn and constructlon of new structures "
" shall comply with the international Building Code; and any ‘alterations, additions, .-
. changes in-use or changes in structures required by this code, which are within the’:.

o ~scope of the lnternatlonal Burldmg Code shall be made in accordance therewrth

o Sectlon 102 5 delete and replace wrth the followmg lanquage

| '-."'_'102 5 H:stonc bu:ldmgs The prowsmns of this code relatlng fo the constructlon . .
~ alteration, repair, enlargement restoratlon,._relocatlon or moving -of buildings or . . -

”':.r:_'structures shall not be mandatory for existing buildings or structures identified and B
-~ - classified by the state or local ]l.ll‘lSdlCthl’] as historic burldrngs when such buildings or - R
... structures do not constitute a distinct hazard to life or property.” Fire protection in -~

desrgnated historic burldmgs and structures shall be provrded ;n accordance wrth an
B "-_approved f:re protectlon plan ' : : : L T o

o Sect|on 102 9 delete and regl ce w:th the followmg lanquage

S 102 9 Conﬂlctmg prows:ons Where there isa confllct between a general requrrement s
= and a specific requirement; the specific requrrement shall be applrcable Where this. = =
s code conflicts with any Surprise Munlmpal Code provsswn or other prov;smns of local' Do
S law, the more restnctrve shall apply S S L

- Sectron 102 10 Add the follow language

o ._""102 10 Re-submlttals When resubmlttmg plans for rewew the rewsed plans shal[ be I

- submitted in ‘accordance the Arizona State Board of Technical Registration. n addition,

- - the revised plans shall inchide the revision date; each revision shall be indicated by a -

clouded area and a detta. A response letter addressmg each [tem on the rewsron shall' L

R accompany the re-submrttal

B .Sectlon 104 6 delete and replace \mth the followmg languaqe

BRI 104 6 Off' cial records The fire department shall keep oft:cral records as requrred by[" S

- Sections 104.6.1 through 104.6.4. Such official records shall be retained for not less - e
S _than the tlme penod establ:shed ln the Flre Chlef’s records retent:on schedule :

Sectlon 104 8 add the followmg language as a second garagragh

'Requests for a modlflcatlon of code reqwrements shall be made in wrltlng on a form

- provided by the Fire Depanment. - The applicant-is responsible for providing all

information, calculations and other data necessary to substantiate each request for a |
- maodification. The Fire Chief shall approve, approve with stipulations or deny such

application, based upon the substantlatlng data submitted and the Fire Chief's -
determination that the modtficatlon does or does not result in substantlal compllance e

7 Ordinance #07-08 - : _- S48
“June7,2007 . A . . S



with the'-intent of "the"cod.e ln dec1d|ng each case, the F!re Chlef may consrder or .

require alternative methods or systems to be used in compensatron for the partrcular_. R
L code provrsron to be modit:ed ' - . :

| ""-.3'-'.".'_Secttcn 104 10 delete and replace wn:h the followmg language

- '104 10 Invest|gat|ons The Flre Department shall mvestlgate or cause to be':- o

. - investigated the cause, -origin and c;rcumstance of each and every fire occurring in the -

- jurisdiction Involving loss -of life or injury to a person or destruction or damage to _
property, and if it appears to the Fire Investigator that such fire is of susprcrous ofigin, -~ o

the Fire Investigator shall notify the appropiiate law enforcement ‘agency. and shall TR

" secure the site until the law enforcement agency takes control of the site. Then, the Fire -

S Investigator shall continue to pursue the investigation fo its conclusion. Information that -

.f.".-;_:__.-could be related to trade secrets or processes shall not be made part of the publiciz:' o
L record unless dlrected byaccurt of Iaw SR s S o E

| 'Sectlon 104 10 1, delete and rep!ace wrth the followrng lanquaqe

104 10 1 Pollce Departrnent lt shall be the duty of the Pcllce Department at the ’ilme o
'~ of any fire, fo place ropes or guards across all streets, lanes or alleys on which 'shalt be =

situated any building on fire, and at such other points as are deemed expedient and

. necessary. Any person entering within the line indicated by such ropes or guards and .- -
-~ . refusing to go outside such lines when directed fo do so by any pohce offlcer or offlcer--;_ i
LNy :ot the Flre Ch|ef shall be gurtty of a class one mrsdemeanor ' _ L

L Sectlon 1 04 12 is herebv added and shall read as follows

. 104.12 Fees. . The Fire Chief shali be' permitted to reduce or waive any and aII ﬁre e

. related fees for permits, plan reviews, inspections and operatlonat services, which are’

" established from tirme to time by resolution of the City Council, for just cause on the ~ -

" pasis of a case-by-case review of the circumstances surroundmg a request for fee

- reduction or fee waiver, provided io the Fire Chief in writing.". Ll
- Sectron 104 12.1. is hereby added and shall read as follows* S

104 12. 1 Payment of fees A permlt shall not be valld untll the fees have been pald o

Nor shall an amendment or extensmn of a permlt be valid until the addlttonal fees lf S

o any, have been paid. -

_Every permit shall become invalid unless the work authorlzed by the permlt is

" commenced, inspections are conducted and approval issued by the Flre Chlef w1th|n 30" P

_ days after issuance of the permlt

Sectron 104 12 2 rs herel_:y added and shall read as follows

104 12 2 Refunds The Frre Chref shall be permltted to author[ze refundlng of a fee -_: |

paid hereunder, which was erroneously paid or collected. - The Fire Chiet shall be . - -

'permitted to authonze refundrng of not more than 80 percent of the permit fee pald

' Ordmance#t)'lﬁa S o . "'47 Do
June7,2007 . - = ' -



“when 'n'o'v;m}k has been done under a permit issued in aoCOrdance with this code. The .~

Fire Chief shall be permitted to authorize refunding of not more than 80 percent of the

o ~ plan review fee paid when an application for a permit for which a plan review fee has

. beenpaid is withdrawn or canceled before any examination or administration time has S

*" been expended. The Fire Chief shall be authorized o waive the plan review fee foran
* éxpired permit § for which no additional plan réview is required. The Fire Chief shall not * -

: "_-E:_'E'-_'be permitted to authorize refunding of any pemit. fee paid except upon. written R
7 application filed by the onglnal permltee not later than 180 days after the date of fee S

: i payment

Sectlon 105 1 1 add the followmq Ianquage as a second_paragraph

) _lt shali be unlawlul for any person f:rm or corporation to use a buridmg or premlses or" - j.'
- engage in any activities for which a permit is determined to be requrred by the F|re
B Chref under thrs code wrthout fll‘St havmg obtalned such perrnlt ' _

Vo Sectlon 105 1 4 is herebv added and shall read as follows

.'105 1 4 Operatmg wrthout a permlt Any person company, frrm corporatlon or entrty._._f_ RO

" operating in violation of section 105.6 or 105.7 shall be subject to double permit fees.

.= . All operations. ‘and/or’ work shall cease untll requrred permrts are obtamed and_"-..-;; -f
"-'__rnspeotlonscompleted fL R P el R

_' '_Sectron 105 2, delete and reglace W|th the followmg languaqe

105 2 Applrcatron Applloatlon for a perrmt requ:red by th|s code shall be made to the S

.- fire department in such form and detail as prescribed by the Fire Chief no later than 30 S

" days prior to date of the event. Appllcations for permlts shall be accompanred by suoh" o
. plans as prescnbed by the Flre Chref . L A

. "'--'.Sect.on 105.2.2, delete and replace \mth the followmg lanquage

| '-.-"'105 22 Inspectlon Requrred Before a new operatlonal permlt is approved the Frre.. .

- Chief shall inspect the vehicles, buildings, devices, premises, storage space or area o
- be used to determrne oomplrance wrth thrs code or any operat;onal oonstralnts requrred '

' Sectron 105 2.2, 2 rs heret_)_y_added to read as follows

) 105 2. 2 2 Tests and mspecuons Penmts shall be subject to tests and mspecttons as-. w
*required by this code and the Fire Chief. The permit fee shall include all primary tests . -

- or inspections and one re-test or re-inspection. An addltronal fee of $150 00 shall be
paid for each addltlonal re- test or re-lnspectlon ' -

. Sec’uon 105 2 3 delete and replace wrth the followmg lanquag___

s . Ordinance #07-08 ._ S S 48
- June7,2007 R



- 105 2 3 Time Irmltatlon of apphcatlon An appllcatron for a permrt for any proposed -
work or operation shall be deemed to have been abandoned six months after the date

T of filing, unless such appllcatlon has been. drtrgently prosecuted or a permit shall have .

~ been issued; except that the fire code official ‘is authorized to grant one more

‘extensions of time for addlticnal perlods not exceedrng 30 days each rf there rs..
.reasonable cause. - S | S .

- Sectlon 105 3 1 delete and replace W|th the followmq language

105. 3.1 Explratlon

“An operational permlt shati remaln in effect untll reissued renewed or revoked or for_--';.-__'.__-'_'_. ;';_
. such a period of time as specified in the permit. Constructlon penmts shall automatically -~ - -~
" become invalid uniess the work authorized by such permit is commenced within 90

. 'days after its issuance; or if the work authorized by such permit is suspended or A

. abandoned for a perlod of 30 days after the time the work is commenced. Before such

- - work recommences, a new permit shall be first obtained and the fee to recommence -

. work, if any, shall be one-half the amount required for a new permit for such work; = .. .
~ provided  no changes have been made or will be made in the orrgrnal construction =~

“documents for such work, and provrded further that such suspensron or abandonment_.-.__ Lo

_ has not: exceeded one year. - Permits ‘are not transferable: and any change ln R

occupancy, operatlon tenancy or ownershlp shal! requrre that anew perm;t be |ssued

_'}7_'_”Sectron 105 3.8 |s hereby added to read as follows

i"'105 3. 8 Operatmg wnthout a permrt ln add:tlon o other remedles provrded by taw o

- any person, company, firm, corporatlon or entity operatmg in violation of section 105.1. 1'_ - S
shall be subject to a double permit fee: AII work shatl cease untrl the requ:red permrts R

'are obtarned and mspec’uons compieted

- "'lt shall be un[awful for any person to contlnue any work after havmg been served wrth a
“stop work order, except such work as that person is dxrected to- pertorm by the Frre

L Chlef in order to remove a wotation or unsafe condrtlon

} Sectlon 105 6 2 delete and re&l_ce wrth the fo!lowmg Ianguage

105 6.2 Amusement burldmgs An operatlonal permrt is requrred to operate a SpeCra| _. S

- amusement building. Plans shall be submitted to the Fire Chief and approved 30 days_- -
: _before the cpenmg of the bu:ldrng or structure to the publlc ' . R 3

) Sectron 105 6 3, delete and replace wrth the followmg Ianguaqe

105. 63 Avratlon facllrtres An operatlonal permrt is requrred to use a Group H or__-

- Group S occupancy for aircraft servicing or repair, the operatlon of aircrait fuel-servicing - Co
vehicles and to self refuel an owner-operated aircraft. Additional permits required by

. other sections of this code include, but are not Irmrted to hot wcrk hazardous materlats_ . C '.

. and flammable or combustlble frmshes

Ordmance#O?OB o o S _49'

) Jure 7, 2007 -



S Sectlon 105 6 24 is herebv added to read as follows

o '105 6. 24 1 Hot work permrts Operatlonal permits are requared to be fllied out by thel : -
" responsible party for the site, siructure, occupancy or property prior to the hot work. * - L
operation. Hot work perm:ts must be kept cn flle for 90 days and be made avallable to.._-_} S

the Flre Chlef

o 'Sectlon 105 6 43 delete and replace w:th the followmg !anguaqe

105 6. 43 Temporary membrane structures, tents and canoples An operatlonal'-'-' RS

' permit is requured to operate an air-supported temporary membrane structure or a tent . e

.~ having an area in excess of 200 square feet ora canopy used for an a occupancy :n IR
. excess of 400 square feet. R S

S Exceptlon Tents used excluswely for recreahonal campmg purposes S

| Sectlon 105 6 48 is herebv added tc read as follows

| 105 6 48 Trade shows and exh|b|ts in burldmgs or structures An operatlonal permlt _ s

s is requ;red to operate a trade show or exhlblt in'a buﬂdlng or Structure

R :Sectlon 106 2 delete and replace wnth the followmg language

- 106.2 Inspectlons The Flre Chlef is authonzed to conduct such mspectlons as are

. deemed necessary to determme the extent of compliance with the provisions of this -~

. code and to approve reporis of inspection by approved agencnes or ‘individuals. - All -+ -"_*-
. reporis of such inspections shall be prepared and submitted in ‘writing for review and

= approval. Inspection reports shall be certified by a respons:ble officer of such approved -

- ~agency or by the responsible individual. ' The Fire Chief is authorized to engage such

- expert opinion as deemed necessary to report upon unusual, detailed or complex. -

“technical issues subject to the approval of the governing body.’ A completed inspection .- :
o shall not be construed to be an approval of a violation or to cancel the provisions of this -~ =
“code or of any other codes or ordinances of the City of Surprise. Inspections.

presuming to give authority to violate or cancel the prows:ons of thls code or of other-_-
_'ordlnances of the Jurlsdictlon shall not be valld ' - - : =

- Sectlon 106 2. 1 is hereby added to read as follows

1062 1 lnspecﬂon requests it shall be the duty of the person domg the work. "

~ authotized by a permit to notify the Fire Chief that such work is ready for inspection. -
~ The Fire Chief is authorized to require that every request for inspection be made not =

less than 72 hours in advance of the desired inspection date. In the case of cancellation

- of inspection received by 8 00 a.m. on the day of lnspectlon an extra fee Wlll not be
: assessed. - - :
Sectlon 106 3 delete and replace W|th the followmg language

B _Grdinance #07-08 o S ._50'.
©o June7,2007. 0 o '




" '."16_6.3"Acce'ss'for ins'pect'i:on.r All work or 'op'e”rations:_ requiring a permit by this code -

shall be subject to inspection by the Fire Prevention Personnel and such work shall - PR
~ remain accessible and exposed for mspectron purposes until approved in writing. 1t o
shall be the duty of the permit applicant to cause the work to remain accessible and - =

. exposed for inspection purposes.: Whenever any such work is covered or concealed . .

) without first being inspected, the Fire Chief shalil have the authority to require that such

" work be exposed for inspection. Neither the Fire Chief nor the City of Surprise shallbe .- . - o

- liable for any expense entailed rn the removal or repIacement of any rnaterral to at!owf____ S o
_for mSpectlon : P e _ . -

. Sectron 108 4 is herebv added to read as follows

. 108. 4 Admm:stratwe appeal Whenever a vuolatlon of th!S code is suspected and the”-' .

applicant wishes to appeal the decision of the staff because the code or the rules R

o legally adopted thereunder have been mcorrectly interpreted or an equrva!ent method of - - R

protectlon or. safety is proposed the applicant may flie an appea! wrth the board of-"f"-'__' -
:'__appeals ' P PR N TS S R i

] | Sectlon 1 09 2 3 delete and replace w:th the followmg language

: '109 2. 3 Prosecutlon of wolatlons If the notlce of v;olat:on is not comphed Wlth\"__lj
promptly (24 hours) the Fire Chief is authorized to issue a citation, requestrng the City .

" Attorney to institute the appropriate legal proceedings at law or in equity to restrain = .
- correct or abate such violation or to require ‘removal or termination of the unlawful

- - occupancy of the structure in wo!atlon of the prowsrons of this code or of the order or: y B
- . _direction made pursuant thereto. . LT : '
o Sectlon 109 3 delete and replace W|th the fo!lowmg Ianguage

. _109 3 V|olatlon penaltles Persons who shall vuoiate a prowsnon of this code or sha!l""_ |

e fait to comp!y with ‘any of the requirements thereof or who shall erect, install, alter, . =

~ repair or do work in violation of the approved. constructlon documentsor directive of the
Fire Chief, or of a permit or certificate used under provisions of this code, shall be guilty

""'_of a class 1 misdemeanor. Each day that a violation contlnues after due notice has -
been served shali be deemed a separate offense Ll : S

- 'Chapter 2, DEFINITIONS

B Sectlon 202 the followmg det‘ n|t|ons are herebv added or amended as fo!lows

_ ATTENDANT A person knowledgeable in the use of portable flre extlngwshers whose_'_:
dutyitisto mamta:n tlre safety measu res durlng publtc or private events as prescrlbed -

: ".::AUTHORITY HAVING JURISDICTION The City of Surprtse Flre Chlef or hIS_ o

s designated representative.
o CHIEF OF THE DIVIS!ON OF FlRE PREVENTION The Ftre Marshal

Ordinance#O?—GS . o _' .51 E
June 7, 2067 : ’ : S e o



. COMMERCIAL OCCUPANCY Any buﬂdrng that falls under the Intematzonal Buuldrng' B
~ Code occupancy classification of A, B, E, F, H, I, M Rt R 2, Sand U except prrvate G
- garages, carports and R 3 accessory structures L N _

. .CORPORATION LEGAL COUNSEL The Clty Attorney

. DEPARTMENT OF FIRE PREVENTION The Flre Marshal s otﬂce

DRIVE LENGTH The measurement from the entrance of the drrve to the structure el

s | FIRE CODE OFFICIAL The Flre Chlef or hIS desrgnee

i GRADE The degree of mcirnatron of a siope road or other surface (see slope)

* " HORIZONTAL (YARD) STANDPIPE. Approved water supply piping that extends the

... source of potabIe water fo remote locations arcund the exterior of a structure..

- _ HOSE LAY. ' The extension of a hand held fire hose as it is extended “from flre
. dpparatus 200 feet around the perimeter of the structure If the hose lay is more than-~

200 feet from the road to aII portrons ot the exterlor an Operatlonal Piatform is requrred .

MODIFIED (Mod) NFPA 13D In addltlon tc NFPA 13D sprrnkler system protectlon : L.- un

sprinkier heads shall be installed in encIosed patios and porches, hidden spaces, . o

- - ‘spaces under egress sta:rways and in garages A one—lnch domestlc water meter |sf T

o requrred

MODIFIED (Mod ) NFPA 13R RES!DENTIAL FIRE SPRINKLER SYSTEM In addrtion ENEIRT A
.. 1o NFPA 13R, sprinkler system protection, sprinkier heads shall be installed in enclosed -
- patios and porches, hidden spaces, spaces under egress staimrays and rn garages A' TR

' _one—lnch domestlc water meter is requrred . . _ o LT e

o OCCUPANCY CLASSIFICATION Thls defrnrtlon shaII be amended as follows

- Grogp = 1 delete the text of the sectlon and regtace wrth the followmg lanquag_ B

:Group I-1 ThIS occupancy shail include bulldlngs structures or parts thereof housrng

~©more than 10 persons; on a 24-hour basis, who because of age, mental disability or -

. other reasons, live in a residential environment that provides supervisory care seivices, = -
The occupants are capable of responding to an emergency situation without physical
assrstance trom statf This group shali mclude but not be Irmrted to the follow;ng

ReS|dent|ai board and care facrhtles
~Assisted living centers - o

.Halfway houses - - .-~

Group homes .. - -

. Congregate care faCIIrtles _ T
'_Socrat rehabllltatron fac:htles e T

. Ondinance #07- 08~ ) SR C B2 :
June 7, 2007 - - g A _ _ _

P’.‘":”"P’!\’r‘



7 Alcohol and drug abuse centers
8 Convalescent fac;htres

A facrhty such as the above wrth 10 or fewer persons shal! be c!assrfled as a Group R- 4 -

- Condition 1 or shall comply with the Intemational Reszdenfzaf Code in accordance with .-

. Section 101.2 of the International Building Code where the buﬂdmg is in comphance_ S
o W|th Sectlon 421 of the !ntemat:onaf Bwldmg Code SRR _ o

: GROUP I 2 deiete the text of the sectron and replace w;th the fo!!ow:ng Ianguage

: "Group |_2 Thrs occupancy shall mclude burfd;ngs or structures used for medlcaf |

" surgical, psychiatric, nursing, custodial, personal or directed care on a 24-hour basis of .
- - more than five persons who are not capable of self-preservation by responding to an, - ©

emergency situation without physrcal ass:stance from staff Thls group shall 1nclude but._ S

" __"not be Ilmlted to the followrng

_'_Hosplta!s-_ -

- NursingHomes. =~ *-. w0 T
Mental hospitals e

: Detoxrflcatlon faczhtles

":r-‘-'.oowef

- 'A facuhty such as the above W|th frve of fewer persons shall be classaf:ed as Group R 3 any )
..+ orshall comply with the !ntemafronal Resrdenfral Code in accordance wrth fnfemafronai -
Bur!dmg Code Sectron 1 01 2 o : B e |

. Thrs occupancy shall afso mc!ude buﬂdlngs or: structures used for assrsted hvmg homes' PRERN

~ providing supervisory, personaf or directed care on a 24-hour basis to more than 10

. persons who are not capable of self-preservat:on by respondlng o an emergency .
5 situation without physical assistance from staff. A facility such as. the above wrth 10 or .o o
fewer persons shall be classrfled as R 4 Condrtlon 2 S o .

GROUP R-4 delete the text of the sect;on and replace mth the fo!lowmg |
: Ianguage I o : _ _ _ N

. R4 Res;dential occupanmes shall include burldings arranged for occupancy as
resrdentlal care/assrsted Ilvmg homes mciud:ng not more than 10 occupants exc!udlng o
o staff : . : . _ _

S Condltlon 1. This oCCupanCy"condltlon' includes: facilities licensed to provide =~
_'supervrsory care services, in which occupants are capable of self- preservatlon by

. responding o an emergency without physical assistance from staff Condltion 1.

o _faculltles housmg mofe than 10 persons shall be classrfled as Group - 1 ' N

: Condltlon 2. Thrs occupancy c!assrfrcatron sha!i inchide facilities Ilcensed to provrde |
-_personal or dlrected ~care serv:ces ln whtch occupants are mcapab!e of self-

C ordinance #07.08 o 83
. Ju_ne?_,zau?' o S i -



" preservation by responding to 'an-er'nergen'c'y without physical assistance form staft |
B Condmon 2 fac:lrttes housmg more than 10 persons shall be classmed as Group l- 2

R4 occupancres shall meet the requrrements for constructlon as deﬁned i Group R- 3 =

except as otherwise provided for in this code, and Intenational Burld:ng Code Section .. -
- 421, or shall comply with the Intemational Residential Code, in accordance . with B
" International Building Code Section 101 2 where the bualdlng is in comp!rance wrth_ SRR

'lnternatzonal Burldlng Code Sectron 421

.PAVED SURFACE A surface of concrete asphalt pavers ‘of other matenal deslgned |

to support flre apparatus in. excees of 75 000 pounds GVW under any weather_‘

condlt:on

- PERMENANT ALL WEATHER SURFACE (PAWS) A road surface made up of

- ~approved materials compacied to 90%-wrth side’ contalnment and capable of .

supporting fire apparatus vehicles in excess of 75, 000 pound gross vehicle weight. - R
. (GVW) undér any weather condition. The permanent ali weather surface shall be_ o
_ malntarned by the property owner tor mtended use by the fire department ' SR

: _SLOPE The ground road or other surface that fon'ns a natural or artlflmal lncllne The -
- percentage of slope is determined by dlvrdlng the rlse by the honzontal run multlplled by. L
100 [% slope (Rise/ﬁun) X 100] oL e T e e e

BN _STREET VALVE An ON/OFF vatve located |n the street used to control the tlow of'}':-_' S
A water to at:re hydrant ' .

E 'fTEMPORARY ALL WEATHER SURFACE (TAWS) A road surface made up of AB or

other approved materials compacted to 80% and capable of supporting fire apparatus- - R )

‘vehicles in excess of 75,000 pound gross vehicle weight (GVW) under any weather .

" condition. The temporary all weather surface shall be maintained by the buﬂder for- o

. intended use by the flre department durlng the constructlon process

o TURNING RADII 2002 AASHTO WB 50 Scale

__ :UNLAWFUL A vrolatlon of thls code whlch may be pumshed by a c:vrl penalty ora’ |
.. criminal penalty, however no person may be pun:shed for the same offense by both a

L crvrl and cnm:nal penalty

- Chapter 3 GENERAL PRECAUTIONS AGAINST FIRE

Sectlon 308. 3 1, delete and replace w:th the followmq Ianquag_

| ""308 3. 1 Open-ﬂame cooklng de\rlces All Charooal bumers LP gas burners and other II

. open-flame cooking devices shall not be operated on combustlble balconles or wrthln

' 10 feet (3048 mm) of combustrble constructlon

Ordinance#0?~f58 _ - 54
© June 7, 2007 . o




| _ Exceptlons One- and two-famlly dwelllngs

s Sectlon 308 3 1 1 delete

" Sectlon 308 3. 6 1 |s herebg dded to read as follows

- 308 3 6 1 Aud|ence control The audience shal] be at least 30 feet away from the o
_closest projection of an open flame device. Audience control shall be established by R
~ use of a physical barrier which can be easily moved or removed in the event of an__.' R

L emergency and shall remaln in place throughout the entlre performance P

Sect|on 308 3 6 2 is hereby added to read as follows

_._"308362 Attendant Flame Effects before an Audrence Performances shall bef'

attended by a person knowledgeable in the proper use of fire extmgurshers Each Lo
.- attendant will watch over no more than two (2) active flame devices.  Aitendants shall =~ .
BT remam at the performance untrl all ﬂames are extingtushed and attendant is dismissed Y

o 'Sectron 308 3 6 3 is herebv added tO read 35 f°“°“’s

- 308 3. 6 3 Flre extmgu:shers Approved fire extmgurshmg equpment shall be readuy'"" S

RS .__'avallable for use during the performance. Portable fire extinguishers’ shall be provrded

N T ata mlnrmum of one 2OBC fire ext[ngwsher for every 4 sumultaneous dewces

B Sectlon 308 3.6. 4 rs hereby added to read as follows

_ '308 3 6 4 Clearance from combustlbles A 30 foot clearance from aII combustrbles-_ S
N shall be malnta:ned in all drrectrons ERR S :

" Section 308 6is hereby added to read as f°"°ws

308 6 Flammg food and beverage preparatlon The preparatron of flamlng foods or_

beverages: in places of assembly and drinking or dmmg establrshments sha!l be in

o accordance with Sectlon 308.6.1 through 308 6.5.

- 'Sectlon 308 6 1 ls herebv added to read as follows

: "-_'30861 Drspensmg Flammabie or combustlble Irqu:ds used in the preparatron of S
ﬂamlng foods or beverages shal! be drspensed from one of the followrng -

' -_A one (1) ounce (29 6 ml) contarner ora contatner not exceedmg one (1) quart (946 5'- o |

 miy capacity with a controlled pourrng dewce that wrll Irmlt the flow o a one (1) ounce
_ (296 rnl) semng : S . - o

' _ Sectlon 308 6 2 ls hereby added to read as follows .' . _. '

Ordinaince #07-03__ . S 5'5
© o June 7, 2007 . ot -




_ 308 6. 2 Contalners not in use. Contarners shaII be secured in an approved manner to
prevent splllage when not |n use.. SO SR SR

Sectron 311 2.2, delete the Exce&ons A :
_Sectron 313. 1 add “or Section 314” to the end of Excemon #2

8 S Add Sectlon 316 HEAT-PRODUCING APBM

' 'Sectson 316 1 |s herebv added to read as follows

S 316 1 General Heatlng apphances sha!l be mstalled and mamtalned in accordancef"-:_;
- with their listing and the Building, Electrical and. Mechanical codes. Cledrance from-

‘combustible material shall be’ mamtalned as set forth rn the Burldrng and Mechamcai B

' codes and the product Irstrng

_' .sectron 316 2 is hereby added to read as follows

L "'316 2 Clothes dryers Lrnt traps on clothes dryers shall be mspected as often as-f e
necessary rn orderto prevent excessrve accumulatlons of Imt bund up D

X Exceptlon Clothes dryers wrthln pnvate dwellrng unrts of Group R Occupanc:es

':Chapter 4, EMERGENCY PLANNING AND PREPAREDNESS

i _'Sectlon 403 1, add the followmg Ianw second oaragam

o There shaII be trarned crowd managers or crowd manager supervlsors at a ratlo of one

“crowd manager/supervusor for every 250 occupants unless otherwrse approved by the o
Flre Chlef : . _ . S . _ .

L Chapter5 FIRE SERVICE FEATURES '_

: | Sectron 501 3, delete and reglace with the foilowmg tanguage

- --_'.501 3 Constructlon documents Constructlon documents requ:rlng a Fire Departrnent o
Permit shall inciude, but not be limited to proposed fire apparatus access, location of -

 fire lanes, means of egress, fire flow testing, hydraulic calculations for fire hydrants and .

S fire protection systems, alarm systems, hazardous occupancies & hazardous materials,
- Interior finishes, smoke control systems, and construction documents specifying interior.” -
finish' and fire resistance rated construction shall be submitted io the Fire Chief for - _'

review and approval prior o construction. The Site Plan shall show ali fire hydrants, Fire
Department Connections and related. underground piping. ‘Upon completion of-

o construction and prior o issuance of a Certificate of Ocoupancy, a copy of finished =

._: " drawings (As Built) shali be provrded to the flre department rn an electronrc format :
acceptable by the Flre Chtef e . : : . :

) Ordmance#o?-os-.. - _ .. 56 -
CJune 7,2007 .0 IR . ST



. '_ Sectlon 503 1 1 deiete and repiace wrth the followrng language

: 503 1 1 Burldmgs and facrlrtres Approved frre apparatus access roads shall be .

. provided for every facility, burldlng or portion of a building hereafter constructed or _:
- moved into or within the jurisdiction. The fire apparatus ; access road shall comply wrth- R
B the requrrements of thrs sectron and shall extend to: S S

_ 'Wrthrn 200 feet of a!! portrons of the facrlrty or all portrons of the exterror walls of the flrstj"' . )
. story of the burldrng as measured by an approved route around the exterror of the:_'_.-":- e

. building or facility. -

o Within 200 feet of the center cf the furthest roon on the second ﬂoor or !evel from thef:'-'_- SR

access road for buildings with two or more. floors.- Travel shall be measured along R

" normal pedestrran routes One fllght of stalrs shall coun’t as 30 feet

o _"Exceptrons The Frre Chref is authorlzed to increase the drmensron of 200 feet where S

- 1. Fire apparatus access roads cannot be installed due to location on property
' -_topography, Waterways non-negotiable grades or other similar condrtrons and -

R " an approved alternative means of fire protection is provrded S
2.0 There are not more than two Group R 3 or Group U occupancres

'Sectron 503 2 4 add to followmg Iangu_age_

503 2 4 Turnmg radu The requrred turmng radlus for frre access roadways shaII be |n'. L
o accordance with 2002 AASHTO WB 50 Scale ' : o : S

e _'--f_'Sectlon 503 2 5 delete and replace wrth the followmg language

| .:503 2 5 Dead end f'fe aF'I:iaratus access. Dead end flre apparatus access roads in

.. excess of 200 feet (45720 mm) in length shall be provrded with an approved area for = -

' turning fire apparatus around. Dead-end fire apparatus access roads Iocated between
" buildings shall have a 10-foot setback from the edge of the access road to the

S __ _structures on each s;de of the road

o 'Sectron 503 3 deletae and reuce wrth the follow_g !anguage

| - 503.3 Markmg Where requrred by the Flre Chref approved srgns wrth red curb."__ |
" markings or other approved notices shall be provided for fire apparatus access roads to -

identify such roads or prohibit the obstruction thereof. Signs, notices and red curb o

" markings shall be maintained in a clean and legible condition at all times, and be .
- replaced or repaired when necessary to provide adequate visibility. All signage to be. .
- consistent wrth the requrrements rn the “Surprrse Frre Department Emergency Access -

| Detalls" book

: _"'in lreu of srgns the top and face of curb shall be palnted red and marked "NO - x
~-* PARKING FIRE LANE" in 4 inch whrte block ietters on the t0p and vertrcal face of the S
curb and spaced 80 feet on center ' : _ CLa

Ordinance #07-08 . L ... BT..

7 June7, 2007



- 503 3 1 is hereby added to read as follows

_ 503 3 1 Mamtenance The person(s) in possesslon of the prem|ses on and into WhICh a o

- fire” apparatus access roadway is. required shall be solely responsible for the =
. maintenance of such roadways and all required signs. No owner, manager or other .
person(s) in charge of premises served by a required fire apparatus access roadway .

.' "'_..___shall abandon or close the fire apparatus roadway or any part thereof without

" permiission of the Fire Chief. - The person(s) in possession of the premlses shall be |

- responsrble for ensurrng that flre apparatus roadways are clear at all tlmes

e Sectron 503 4 delete and reptace W|th the followm_q language

k 503 4 Obstructlon of f' re apparatus access roads F:re apparatus access roads
. shall not be obstructed in any manner, including the parking of vehicles. For the - . = .
ﬂpurposes of this "section, ‘parking is- defined as’ stopped vehicles - with no driver

ocecupying the driver’s, position. . Other occupants of the vehicle do not count as the .. o

N “driver. - The minimum widths and clearances established in Section 503.2.1 shall be - = - °
.. maintained at all times: The. person in possession of the premises shall be re_sponsrbleﬂ___: T
S to ensure that flre apparatus access roadways are unobstructed at aII t|mes j S o

Y . ':Section 503 6, delete and replace wrth the followmg language

'503 6 Secur{ty gates Separate FD Permlt requnred Plans o :nstall security gates.-‘"-"

- across fire apparatus access: roads shall be’ ‘submitted fo. the Fire Chlef for review. . L
" When security gates are approved : all means of emergency ‘operation shall be provided .

" and maintained. All gates to be consxstent wrth the requrrements in the Surpnse Flre" Do

L Department Emergenoy Access” book

_ Gates across flre apparatus access roads at gated commumtles and where requrred by -

- the Fire Chief shall be electronic and shall be provided with approved preemption -

L _equment controls electronlc knox key swrtch and manual release mechanlsm

'Ex:stlng gates at main entry pomts to gated communltles shall upgrade the gates to .:': '
: lnclude preemptlon equrpment wrth:n one year of the etfectwe date of th!s code o

Exceptron When the gate |s removed trom the entry polnt '

| 50361 1s hereby added to reacl as follows

. 503.6.1 Clear W|dth Clear Wldth of the roadway Shall be minimum of 20 feet clear .
© width at all entrances. Exit roadways shall be a minimum of 16 feet clear wrdth at all o

. exits, unless otherwrse approved by the Fire Chlef

o 503.6.2 is heret_av_ added to read as follows.

. Ordinance #07-08 S S ' 58
June 7, 2007 .- . o e . .



503 6 2 DlVlded entrance Sub DlVlSlons may have a d:\nded entrance and e)(lt The .

entrance side shall have. a clearance of 20 feet clear wrdth the exrt S|de shall have a 16 o

_ _feet clear wrdth Gates shall be S|zed to match the openmg

C 503 6 3is hereby added to read as follows

503 6. 3 Gates Gates shall be deagned s0 that the access roadway or turmng radius___'- o

(WB50) shall not be obstructed by the operation of the gate. Minimum set back from: - -~ =

S the public streets shall be a distance determined by the City Engineer and allow the |

" emergency vehicle the ability to safely operate the lock box or panel Turnlng radius -

o ': _'from the publlc street shall be WB50

'503.6. 4 |s hereby added to read as follows

. '-';.-'-'.503 6 4 Access controls Access controls shali be exterlor to the gate and located for'-_‘_'._"-
‘activation by the vehicle operator without leaving the vehicle. The height of the lock. -

L box/control panel shall be 66 |nches measured from the flnlshed grade Ilne of the_" 3

o 503 6 6 is herebv added to read as follows.

e __ '503 6.6 Traff' ic preemptlon Traffic Preemptlon openmg devrces (T OMAR) shall be

. installed on all motonzed gates and gated communltles that secure pnvate streets or'-_ g L

L '_roadways

R _"i”--"_503 6.7 is herebg added to read as follows

.. 503.6. 7 Gate tlmmg Gates must fully open wuthln 15 seconds of actlvatlon a_nd remam

. m the open posrtlon untll closed by operat:on of the electncal control dev:ce

o : 503 6 8 is herebv added to read as fo!!ows

503. 6 8 Control pedestal The control pedestal must be ldentlfred wrth a minimum 6-

"inch by 10-inch sign with red letiers on a white background. This sign must be securely B
fasiened to the pedestal and Ieg|ble from the approaching vehicle. Frre Department__-_

_ access gates shall fail safe (open) in the event of a power fallure

R 503.6. 9 is hereby added to read as as follows

. 50369 Secondary access. Secondary "Exrt Only“ gates shaIE be set up for Flrej o
. Depariment emergency access. EXit only -gates, wh_lch are not motorized, shall be . -
- installed per the fire department standard detaill. - Exit Only Gates shall have a -
* minimum clearance of 20 feet clear width and be posted with a sign that states "Caution
. Gate Opens Out.* The ground shall be palnted wath ab mch yellow Sl:rlp showmg the_ o
_depth ofthe gate swrng ' . e . .

Ordinance#{}?-oa_._- . '_ o ' ST 59
June 7, 2007 7 T o -



R _' 503 6 10 is herebv added to read as follows

| 503 6 1 0 Pre-emptlon devrce Operatron of the gate shall be by pre emptron dewce.- o

- _and/or key—swrtch

. Sectron 503 7is hereby added to read as follows

. 503.7 Graphic directories. Approved graphic. dlrectones shall be provrded at an

- driveway entrances for all multiple dwelling developments, mobile home. parks, or when™ LA )
- required by the Fire Chief.. Such directories shall be ilfuminated and conform to the Crty o
Cooof Surpnse desugn standards and be approved by the Ftre Chlet s -

I -"'_Emstmg facmtles shatl prowde rllummated graphrc dlrectorles wrthln one year of the; L
eﬁectrvedateofthlscode LT R P T S '

A Sectlon 503 8 1s herebv added to read as foliows |

' .503 8 Frre statron and hydrant access lt |s unlawful to cause any obstructlon to be:' : _- :
. placed 'within' 10 feet of the entrance to any fire station or other plaoe where fire ..

apparatus is stored or wrth 15 feet of any flre hydrants

_'Sectron 505 1 delete and replace \mth the followmg Ianquaqe R

"5051 Address numbers New and exrstlng burldlngs shall have approved address_ |

<~ numbers, building numbers or ‘approved buitding | ldentrflcatlon placed in apositionso- . ...
~ that the number |s plamly teglble and vrmble trom the street or road frontmg the'_”__,__ S

S 'property

o Commermat and Resrdentral address numbers shall be located on the burldlng at a
" ;polnt closest to the street as approved by the Flre Chref ' : o

_ "Commercral address numbers shail be Contrastlng in color tenant space numbers or

' letters shall be in contrasting color, 4 inches in height, 1 inch in width, and shall be

| displayed above the front door and on rear door so that the number is plainly. legible
- and visible from the street or road frontlng the property See Table 1 for cornmercral
-buuldmg addressrng _ - : :

S Table 1 Commercral addressmg n
SRR Table 1- L -

0 to 50 feet numbers shall be 9 mches in

height, 2- inches in width.

51 {0 100 feet, numbers shall be 12 mches in

| height, 3-inches in widih. '

101 feet or more, numbers: shall be 15

: lnches in herght 4 :nches in Width

. Crdinance#O?—OS e . 60 :
- June 7,2007° . o



" Residential numbers shall be located on: the residence in a contraSting color and shall
" be 4 inches in height, % inch in width, and shall be dispiayed on front and rear access

o doors so that the number |s ptamly Iegible and vusnble from the street or road frontlng.-,'- . o
_the property e IR ¥ -

o Resmlentlal (one and two famlly unlts) numbers shall be Iocated on the resrdenoe at the' L
~ closest point to the roadway so that the number is pialnly Iegible and vrsrble from the o

street or road frontrng the property

.'Ftesmientlal (Multl-farnliy unlts) Apartment numbers shall be cotor contrastlng and-'_:_f-'\ '

located on the unit at the closest point to the roadway so that the number is plainfy =~ = .
-~ legible” and visible from the street or road frontmg the property See Table 2 for-'-_. R
"resadentrat applloatlon o p ST

- '__-__'"Table 2 Resudenttal Multt—famﬂy Addressmg

T Table2 R
. 0 to 50 feet numbers shall be 4 lnches in hetght SO
More than 50 feet numbers sha[l be 6 mches in (s '
helght R : R -

ol Apartment Numbers & Corrldor Numbers Apartment numbers are to be a mimmurn -
seven (7) inches in height with a one (1) inch brush. stroke with contrasting background, * .

- Corridor numbers are to be'a minimum of four (4) inches in height with a flve—etght (5/8) o
: .-;__|nch brush stroke wlth oontrastmg background See Table 2 1 for exampie T

S Table21
301—310 3" Fioor

201210 2 9 Floor .
101 ~ 110 18‘ Floor o

- 'Sectlon 506 1 2 |s herebv added to read as fc!lows

g . 506.1.2 Locatlon A minimum of one recessed key box is requrred for each occupancy,
e _Addltlonal boxes may be requrred dependlng on cccupancy and the physrcal structure

o Othermse A full set of keys to open a!l doors :nsude and outsu:ie the structure to

" include the fire alarm panel, shall be labeled for use and placed inside the key box. Key o
:. boxes shall be mounted no higher than 60 inches above finished grade. Key bo_xes o

" shall be located on the et side of the entrance, or as approved by the Fire Chief.

- Exception: [f whole complex is serviced by one master key, one box is sufficient. This

.. box must be Iocated on the Ieft side of the main entrance or as approved by the Flre'
_'Chlef LT SRR : _ o

"506 1.3 Knox box The Iock box (Knox Box) padlook or key swrtch must be an. -

- approved model utrlrzed by the Flre Department Authorrzed_ K_n_o_x Bo_x_torms are -

Ordlnance#ﬁ?ﬁa ST 61
June 7, 20067 - S . 3 . S




o avarlable at Clty of Surpnse F:re Preventlon Offlce Monday through Fnday 8 00 am to -
5 00 pm ' : . _ . T

U Sectlon 508 1 delete an d replace W|th the followmg Iangyggg,

508 1 Requlred water SUPP!V An approved water sUPP]Y capabte of supplylng the"'-'. -

B required fire flow for fire protectlon shall be provided to premises upon which facilities, - - '.
building or portions of builldings are hereafter constructed or moved into or within the

jurisdiction. Where property is subdrwded with or without the creation of public or private

. streets for the express purpose of providing said subdivided parcels for sale or:--_.'.j L
: _’otherwuse permitting separate and/or individual development to occur, an approved - -

. water supply capable of supplylng the projected fire flow for fire proteotton shall be .
" provided and extended 1o serve directly any and all subdivided properties. ' The

A ~ projected fire flow will be based on the greatest potential demand posed by any type of | _:. L
. occupancy allowed by zoning laws on the proposed property. Required water SUPP’V*: o

shall not be lnterrupted for any reason, wrthout prlor approval of the flre chlef

R Sectson 508 4 delete and replace wuth the followmq |anguaqe

. 508, 4 Water supply test The Fire Chlef shall be notlfled of aII water supply tests and

S the resuits of those tests.. The Fire Chief or his designee shatl rewew aII documentatron - i

o __prror to final approval of the water suppiy system REE

- Sectron 508 4.1 is herebv added to read as follows

| 508 41 Flow Test Documentatlon It is the responsnb:llty of Developers/Bullders to SR

. ‘submit fire flow test data to the City Planner and the Fire Department. Detailed test-

~ result data shall be prowded to the flre department ln an electronro fonnat acoeptable
o bytheFlreChlef . Lo o _ SRS _ -

. ; Use the followmg tables and references

. 1 Use Table B105 1 2006 IFC for Fire Flow and Duratlon 1for buﬂd:ngs
B 2. Use Table C105.1 2008 IFC for Number and Distribution of Fire Hydrants _
- 3. Use IFC Section B105 2 Bmldrngs other than one- and two famliy dwellmgs

'I Sectton 508 4. 2 is herebx added to read as follows

- -_Z; 508 4.2 Certtf' cate of occupancy. Certlflcate of occupancy tor any structure shall not" o

be issued prior to final approval of the water supply system by the Fire Chief

i E Sectlon 508.5. 1 delete and replace with i the following Ianguage

508. 5 1 Where requnred Where the most remote portaon of the facmty or bwldlng.- _
hereatfter constructed or moved into or within the j_unsdlc’non is more than 150 feet from

. a hydrant on a fire apparatus access road, as measured by fire apparatus driving - -

Ordinance #07-08 . . . .. 82
. dune 7, 2007 N o o -



e defecttve

o around the exterior ot the facrhty or burldlng, on-site flre hydrants and malns capable of_j_ R

E 'supplying the requrred fire flow shall be provrded where requrred by the Flre Chief

Exceptron For Group R 3 and Group U Ocoupanoles the dlstance reqwrement shaliz'- '
be 500 feet (122m) R _ _ . .

g .Sectlon 508 5 2, delete and remce mth the followmg Ianguage

'508 5. 2 Inspectlon testmg and mamtenance Flre hydrant systems shall be sub]ect'

R S to periodic tests as required by the Fire Code Official. Fire hydrant systems shall be -

‘maintained in an operatwe condrtron at aII tlmes and shall be promptly repalred where..i__-_ S

j_._'-:__.ff-_The F:re Chlef shall approve ali addltlons repalrs' alteratlons and servrcrng of water-':_'.ﬂ
_suppiy and frre hydrants systems SR S _ ST

Sectlon 508 5 2 1 IS herebv added to read as follows

S 508 5. 2 1 Requrred mstallatrons Flre hydrants rnstal!ed as a result of any order or _ i
- permit shall be spaced so that short hose lines can be utilized and so there are'a .

- sufficient number of fire hydrants within a reasonable distance 1o obtain the requrred fire

" flow as determined using Appendix B. In other than single-family residential areas,
hydrants shall be spaced so that they are not more than’ 300 feet (91.5m) apart. For

o one- and two-family dwellings, hydrants shall be spaced so that they are not more than. -
- 500 feet (152.5m) apart and not more than 400 feet (122m) hose lay from the center of .

o any structure Hydrant spaczng and hose lay reqwrements may be modrfred by the Fire' : -

o Chief.

o Prwate F|re Hydrants AII pnvate f:re hydrants (those not on the Crty of Surprise water' L

system and/or located on private property) must be flushed and maintained annually in* ' o
accordance with the American Water Works Association, Manual of Water Supply - .

Practices, Instailation Field Testing and Maintenance of Fire hydrants, AWWA M17. _
~ Selected hydrants, as determined by the Fire Chief, shail be tested to determine -
Available Fire Flow according to test procedures outlined in the American Water Works:

| . Association Manual of Water Supply Practices, Distribution System Requirements for :
Fire Protection, AWWA M31. Resuits of the testrng shall be prowded in an electronio__.-_, L

format acceptable to the Fire Chief.

Public Fire Hydr-ants. All public frre hydrants must be fl'us"he_d and m_aintained annually
in accordance with the American Water Works Association, Manual of Water Supply .

-Practices, Installation Field Testing and Maintenance of Fire hydrants, AWWA M17.- "

. Selected hydrants, as determined by the Fire Chief, shall be tested to determine
Available Fire Flow according to test procedures outlined in the American Water Works_'
~ Association Manual of Water Supply Practices, Distribution System Requirements for

- Fire Protection, AWWA M31. Results of the tesiing shall be prowded o the flre..___.-. |

department in an electromc format acceptable to the Fire Chlef

Ordinance #07-08 - . R '_ 83

S June7,2007 . -



h ' .Prwate fire hydrants (all types)

- F|re Hydrants AII flre hydrants shall be in accordance wrth MAG standards for Dry_,-."-'

- Barrel Fire Hydrants, as defined by AWWA M17 and specified by the City of Surprise

Water Services Depariment and Engineering Department. Fire Hydranis used in all

- applications shall have two 2% inch outlets and one 4‘/2 :nch cutiet All outlets shall'; PR
have Natrcnai Standard Threads (NST) L : - .

- Sect:on 508 5 3 delete and rep!ace wrth the fcllowmg Ianguage.

e 508 5. 3 Prrvate t' ire ser\rlce mams and water tanks Prrvate flre ser\nce rnalns and._'-_f o

"~ “water tanks shall be periodically mspected tested and mamtamed in accordance wrth
L __NFPA25 atthefcllcwrng mtenra!s ST S DR

1L Inspectlcn annua[ly and after each cperatlcn ficw test and servrce annually

K 2. Fire service main plplng Inspectrcn cf expcsed annualiy, ficw test everyflve (5) B

T years.
...~ 3. Fire service main prpmg stralners Inspectlon and malntenance after each use.

- 4, Fire hydrant systems. . Plans and specrflcaticns for fire hydrant systems shallbe. .~ -
- ‘submitted to the fire depastment for review and approval prior to construction,
" Plans and specrflcatlons for fire hydrant systems shall be submitted to the fire -
" depariment for review and approval prior to City. Ccuncn action on the final .~ ...
~ subdivision plat, or in the case of an individual building or structure, for re\new'_-é\ conl L]
-+ and approval prior fo issuance of the building permit. The Fire Chief shall obtain- . ~* * -
. the approval of the Engrneerrng Department on the submltted plans and -

-specrﬁcatrons

_"_Water service prcvrders whether munlcrpal or pnvate shail submlt a map |dent|fy1ng
. the location of fire hydrants within the setvice aréa of the water provider, The map -

| .requrred under this subsection shall be submitted on or before December 31, of each - S

year, and shall be updated by the water service provider as new fire hydrants are .

installed. On May 31, of each subsequenit year, a map 1dent|fymg the location of the fire

o 'hydrants within the service area of the water prcwder shall be submiited to the Fire = ..
. Chief. In the eveni a water service provider fails to submit the map required under. -

B subsection 5 of this section, the Fire Chief is authorized to prepare a map of the fire

hydrant locations within the service area of water service provider, and charge the cost . -

~ of preparation of the map to the water service provider, tcgether wrth an adminrstratlve o
- fee equal fo 15 percent of the ccst of preparatrcn of the map ' - '

'.._A water servrce prcwder whether munrclpal or prrvate havmg a Pcrtlon of rts servrce"_ E

L area in which no distribution or service fines are located, shall identify such areas onthe =~ |
* map required by this subsection. Such areas shall be exempt from the requirements of ; -

o Sections 508.1 through 508.4 and Appendix B and C untll dlstrlbutlon cr ser\nce Irnes_-.
_ are znstalled by the water service prcvrder TR . _ o _ 3

. On or befcre December 31, cf each year, each water service provrder whether-_'__'_'- o g

_ mumcrpal or pnvate shall have prepared and filed wrth the flre department a plan thai:

"Ordmance#O?OB : R 64
dune? 2007 : o T



O 'lndlcates sufﬁcuent hydrants on all streets wﬁhm lts water semce area contamlng water _ ‘

utility distribution or service lines to compiy with the requirements of International Fire .

L Code, Appendix C- Flre Hydrant Locatlens and Dlstnbutlon lncludlng but not llmlted to_:- o

" Table C105.1 or

A five year Capital Imprevement Plan [ndicatlng plans for the construction of suftlc:ent' '_

R - hydrants ‘on all strests within it water service area containing water utility distribution or o

' " service lines to comply with the requirements of 2003 Intemnational Fire Code, Appendix -
. C- Fire Hydrant Locations and Distribution, including but not _Ilmlted te Table 0105 ‘l_ o
' 'wrthrn tlve (5) years from the date of subm|SS|on ot the plan ' : T

Tt On or before January 10 of each year followmg submrssnen of the plan the F|re Chlef___ [
. shall file with the City Clerk, the Directors of Community Development Water Services =

- Dept., Englneenng Dept and the appllcable water provider, a written notice indicating .

" “each water service provider who is not in compliance with -the requirements of.;.-'.i_'f' L
""" subsection 5 of this section. Upon frllng of the written notice with the City Clerk, no = =
e bwldlng permit shall be issued within the service area of a water service prowder who is. ST
L -_'-_,not in compllance W|th the reqmrements ef subsectlon 5 of th:s sectron ' el

L _"A water service prowder that belleves a notlce has been lmpreperly |ssued under thls R

< section, may appeal the issuance of the notice to the City Manager, by filling a written
" . notice of appeal to the City Manager within ten (10) days after filing of the Notice in

% subsection (6) with the City Clerk. The City Manager or histher desrgnee shall hold a S

| :'.-.'_'_heanng on the appeal wuthln thlrty {30) days afterflllng of the appeal PR ER T

e Chapter 6, BUILD[NG seavrces AND SYSTEMS

" . 'Sectlon 605 10 is hereby added to read as fot!ows

) 605 10 electrlcal senuce shut off access Where electrrcal ser\nce shut off contrels

" are located inside a building, a door providing direct access from the exterior to the - - L

- room contamlng such electncal shut off controls shall be provrded when requ:red by the )

o 'Ftre Chlef

R chapters INTERIOR FINISH DECORATIVE MATERIALS AND FURNISHINGS

| _-'Sectlon 807 4 3 1 delete Exceptions # 1 and # 2

.., - 'Sectuon 807 4, 4 1 delete Excep_ons # 1 and # 2. # 2 : -' :

_ | Chapter 9 FIRE PROTECTION SYSTEMS ' o
Sectlon 901.2.1, delete and replace with the followmq Ianguage

901.2.1. Plans for f re sprlnkler systems. Complete plans and hydraullc calculatlons' -
for fire sprinkler system installation shall be submitted for review and approval prior to.

- installation, modification or alteration. Plans shall be drawn to an indicated scale, on -~
' sheets of uniform size . and shall show as a mlnimum the data reqwred by NFPA 18,5 0

Ordinance #07- 08 o ST o 65_

- June 7, 2007 _



2002 Edrt;on Chapter 6. Manufacturer‘s cut sheets for all equrpment used shall be

included wrth the original submlﬁal Water supply data for hydraulic calculations shall be. . _
- based on 80 percent of ihe available water supply as. determined. by flow fest - .

- information. An additional copy of these plans shall be submitted in an electromo format
sultable to the Fire Chlef . L - A

) Sectlon 901 2 2 is herebv added to read as follows |

.901 2 2 Plan submlttals Plan submlttals shall be m accordanoe wrth the standard-_.' |

'plan review format as provided by the Arizona Automatic Fire Alarm Association.: Shop o |

s drawmgs shall accompany construotion documents at the tlme of lnltlal submlttal

' _Sectlon 901 2. 3 is herebv added to read as follows

90123 Plan certifications for fire sprlnklers Al tlre SDrznkler plans submltted t the S

- fire depariment.for review and approval shall bear a review certification stamp and-~
“ signature of an AZ Professional Design Fleg:strant or Levet lil National lnstltute for the '

e Certlflcatlon of Englneermg Technologles (NICET) in fire. spnnkler Systems T o

o _Sectlon 901 2 4is hereby added to read as follows

o 901.2.4 Plan certlficatlon for all other f" re protectlon systems Plan certlflcatlon for_'.. S

~ all other fire protection systems shali be accompanied by a certification of competence : ¢ ..

..+ when required. Shop drawings for all other fire protectlon systems shall accompany__-_ e
.. construction documents at the time of initial submittal. ' N P

5 _Sectlon 901.2.5 is herebv added to read as follows

901.2.5 Plan cert|f' cation for fire alarms and occupant notlf' cat|on All f|re alarm G

i system plans submitted to the fire department for review and approval shall bear a. . |

review cetrtification. stamp and signature of an Arizona Professional Design Registrant

or Level lIl National institute for the Certification of Engineering Technologies (NICET) . .

L ~ in Fire Alarm Systems. Plan certification for ali fire alarm systems shall be accompanied .~ :

by a ceriification of competence when required. Shop drawmgs shall accompany__ S
construct:on doouments at the tlme of initial submlttal R o

'_--Sectton 901.2.6 is hereby added to read as follows;_-_ -

' 901.2.6 On site plans, specifications and permits. Fire department approved plans, o
- specifications and permits shall be retamed on the job srte and made avarlable to the:'_

fire inspector on each inspection.’
- Section 901.4, delete and replace with the followmq Ianquaqe

901 4 lnstallatron Fire protectlon systems shall be mamtalned in accordance wuth' .

original installation standards for that system. Systems shall be exiended, altered or

. augmented as necessary to maintain and continue protection whenever the building is .- . n _'

Ordinance #07-08 . -
June 7, 2007 - . . ERE )



. Section 901641 hereby added to read as follows -

'altered remodeled or added tc Alteratlons to flre protectlon systems shall be done lnj'_ R
e _'_accordance wuth applicable standards ' S

o 'Sectlon 901 4 1 2 IS hereby added to read as follows

o 901 41 2 lnspectors test valve The lnspectors Test Valve shall be Iocated on the, o

e “end of the most distant sprlnkler plpe on each story and shall be equrpped wrth a readlly. B
- _.:'."acces3|ble brass shutoff valve ax _ o . _ '

"_-"Sectlon 901 6.3 is hereby added to read as follows

C '901 6.3 lnspectlon, testmg and malntenance AII fire and Ilfe safety systems;“' o

including but not limited to: fire: extzngwshers frre alarms ‘water supply and fire hydrant -

“systems, backflow prevention devices, " fire sprinklers and standpipes, chemical .

extmgu:shmg systems and other types of automatic fire extinguishing. systems. RS S

Basement pipe inlets ‘and other fire-profection systems and appurtenances shall be

= inspected, tested and maintained on an annual basis, after each use or as often as -
'+ required by the Flre Chief to ensure operability by nationally recognized standards. Test S
* records and lags shall be retained on site by the. occupant of the building and a copy.. -

“mailed to the Surprise Fire Departmmient, Fire Prevention Division. These systems shall .. R
" be inspecied, . tested and maintained. by a contractor holding a, Certlftcate of,_' e
- Perlormance Card Permlt rssued by the Flre Chlef R P FIR S LR

901.6.4 Performance examrnatton To perfcrm wcrk on fire and Ilfe safety systerns in e
~the City of Surprise, all contractors andfor service personnel must submit to- and

- satisfactorily pass a performance examination. The examination will be provided by an =~ -
outside agency approved by the Fire Chief. The cost of such examination shall be the ~ - -
- responsibility of the mdw;dual(s) taklng the examlnatlon A fsre department renewable S
- feeof $50 00 w;ll be accessed annually S L

' Sectlon 901 6 5 is hereb\rr added to read as follows

' 90165 Contractors. Contraciors and service personnel must obtain a Cert:ﬁcate of
Performance Card from the Surprise Fire Department prior to. working in the City: of-_ B

'Surprlse The Fire Department wrll recogmze a valld performance card from any .
Arlzona jurlsdlctlon : _ . R

_Sectlon 901.7, delete and replace W|th the followmg Ianguage

'901 7 Systems out of service. Where a requnred flre protectlon system is out of - N _
- 'setvice, the Fire Chief shall be notified immediately, and where required by the Fire

~_ Chief, the building shall either be evacuated or approved fire waich or standby
- personnel shall be provuded for all occupants untz! the flre protectlon system has been-_' :

" returned io servrce

__Ordinance#{)?os o : ST '. 87
June 7, 2007 _ : R R



Where utllrzed flre watches shall be prevrded W|th at least one approved means for

‘communication with the fire department, and their only duty shall be to perform constant T

patrols of the protected premises and keep watoh for flres

L A requrred flre sprlnkler systern or frre alarm system shall not be placed out of servrce e

o for more than 8 hours in any one day wrthout wrrtten authorrzatron by the Flre Chlef

L Sectlon 901 8 add the followmg language

901 8 Tampermg wrth f' re hydrants and street valves lt shall be unlawful for anyl

7. person to remove, tamper with, disturb or otherwise vandalize in any manner, any fire' S

hydrant or street valve requrred by this code. Any tampering with fire hydrants and -

 street valves wrthout prror approval from the Fire Chief shall be a class 1 misdemeanor. IR

: Exceptron By the water prov:der durlng tlmes of repalr servrce mamtenance and BRI
'."_testrng : . T B R _ o . -

- Sectlon 901 8 1 delete and replace wrth the followmg Ianguage

: '.;.'901 81 Use of fi re hydrants durmg constructlon Use of flre hydrants for the-': IR

. . purpose of site development must be approved by the F|re Chief. The contractor shall. - " ° -

. request, . in writing, approvai to attach appliances to fire hydrants. Fire hydrants shall bej_

' mspected prior to water—meter attachment and durrng removal by the f|re department

. Sectlen 903 1 1 delete and replace W|th the followmg Ianquag_

'903 11 Commercral development ‘All_new commercral occupancres for whrch a{---';_

‘building or construction permit is obtalned shall be protected by a fully automatic.

| ~ sprinkler system. Installation of thé sprinkler system shall be in aceordance with the-i-_” R

. requrrements of NFPA 13 2002 Edrtlcn unless otherwrse approved by the Frre Chlet

o Exrstmg burldlngs structures and occupancres wrll not requrre retroflttlng wrth frre”-'
:sprlnkier systems to meet current code standards un!ess S o

: Burldlng cccupant Ioad is increased wrthout mcreasrng square footage

1.
- 2. Qccupancy classification is changed to a hrgher hazard level
3. Structure fire resistance rating is decreased.. - ' :
4. Work affects more than fifty percent (50%}) of the emstrng bulldlng floor area. -
‘5. Building addition increases the exrstlng buﬂdmg floor area by more. than flfty L
.~ percent {50%). - o L '
Sectron 903.2 Excep_on Ilst IS added as follows
Exceptlons R o
Detached gazebos ramadas restrooms', guardhouses, and equipment or
storage burldrngs Ll N T
" Ordinance #0708 I - 68

. Jdune7,2007 0 .



2 -Detached non-ccmbustlble carports wrth covered parklng not exceedrng 15 000' -' ST

square feet.

3 3. Detached non-combustlble canopres used exc!usrvely for automotrve motor fuel- - '_ -
- . dispensing. Canopies where vehrcles are attended and in place on a temporary' N

- basis, for non-maintenance activities..
4 Detached non-ccmbustrble non-occupled water supply Booster Pump structures ;-

SRR "'For the purposes of thrs section of thrs code ‘TEMPORARY” is defrned as any pencd_.-'-’:

- less than 8 hours in any 24 hour perlod

-_.:_3__’_'_"'NOTE AII e!ements of the structure wrth regard to property Ilnes set backs and zcn:ng' L _'
: _-'_'_shall comply wrth Plannlng and Zonrng gurdelrnes _:;; R S A

o Sectton 903 2, 7 1 rs heretly_dded to read as follows

o 903 2. 7 1 Group R Dwrsron 2. All Group R Division 2 occupancres shall be requrred o

_. “install a Mod. NFPA 13R Resideniial Fire Sprinkler System.  If any portion of a patro"f_’-'" e
= has livable space drrectly above the enclosed patrc the patlo shall have sprlnkler'-'._.
) "_*__protectron IRUEEIRRE I R o

) Sectron 903 2 7 2 |s hereb added to read as follows

'_ 903 2 7. 2 Group R DIVISIOI’I 4 All Group R D:vrsron 4 occupancles hav:ng as&sted R
7 living residents, exclusive of the care giver and their family, or day care, shall be:_'-' S
. required to install a Mod. NFPA 13D Residential Fire Sprinkler System throughout [

including attached garages. I any portion of a patio or porch has livable space dlrectly__} A I

above the patio or porch, the patio or porch shali have sprinkier protection.

+ Such systems shall contain an elecironically supervrsed valve located between the :
- - domestic water riser control valve and the sprinklers - : : TR
In R-4 Condition 2 facilities, such systems shall mclude concealed spaces ccntalnlng_ a

- combustible materials, and shall contain water flow switches electrically supervised by - - -

 an approved Central Staticn and shall sound an alarm ata constantly attended locatlon o
© inside the facility. L
. Minimum listed electronic components for alarms shall conS|st of an auto draler and an =

: '_ mterror horn and strobe connected to the flre rrser ﬂow swrtch

e "Sectron 903. 2 7 3 is hereby added to read as follows : ' ) -
- 903.2.7.3 Group R, Bivision 3. A Mod. NFPA 13D Residential Flre Sprrnkler System- )

- shall be installed in Group R, Division 3 occupancies. If any portion of a patio or porch - i
. has livable space drrectly above the patro or porch the patlo or porch shall have' I

- 'sprrnkler protectlcn

'Exceptlon Flesrdentlal Spnnklers may be omltted from Group R DIVISIOﬂ 3 "

occupancies as long as ihe required fire flows in accordance with Appendix B~
- Fire-Flow Requirements For Buildings and Table B105 1 Mrnlmum Flequrred Flre__ T

- Flow and Flow Duratlon For Burldrngs are met

Ordinance#l)?oa . o '_ ' 3 .89
June 7, 2007 L e o _



" Seot:on 903 2 7 3 1 is herebv added to read as follows

'-'_903 2 7.3.4 Group R Dwrsson 3 ‘Each bu:lder oontractor or developer shall offer asan
- optlon at the t:me of purchase o each homebuyer a res:dentlal ﬁre Spnnkler system

E 'Sectlon 903 2 7 3 2 |s herebv added to read aS fOHOWS

| '903 2732 Comparatrve cost. The opt;on shall mclude ‘a oomparatzve cost for ", o
- installing a modified NFPA 13D ‘automatic fire sprinkler system. ThlS optlon shall be. S

L _ mcluded on the bu1lder contractor or developer s [ist of opt;ons

o Sectlon 903.2. 7 3 3 is herebv addEd to "ead as f°“°ws

_"'.'903 2.7. 3 3 Drsplay an approved sample of a Nod. NFPA 13D Resndentlal sprmkler-."-_ N . | E
. system riser and two types of sprinkier heads {exposed and conoealed) The
- builder, contractor or developer shall provide ‘an approved NFPA 13D, 2002 Edition, =~ . .

- automatic fire spnnkler system modet in the sales office of each subdivision, A spnnkler ST
o7 system model is not requrred tf show home/sales models have a Spnnkler system SR
L '|nstalled : . : Lo '

S Sec’uon 903 2 7 3 4 :s hereby added to read as follows

o ._ 903 2.7.3.4 Educatlonal materlals The bu:lder contractor or developer shall prov;de S A

) o each home-buyer a copy of educa’nonal matenals prepared by the Flre Department on’” S |
o 'reS|denttal fire sprlnkler systems R N e e o o

Sectlon 903 2 7 3 5 is hereby added to read as follows

-_"903 2735 Afﬁdawt A slgned afﬂdavut by the buyer mducatang that thls op’non was o

~ offered and refused shall be retained by the developer at his home office and available

for inspection by the Fire Chief for a period of one year from the time of closure of the DECERR

o _ resrdence A copy of the srgned afﬁdav;t shali be attached to the apphcatlon for permlt

: Sectlon 903 2.7 4 is added to read as follows

. 903.2.7.4 Speolal Requ:rements for Group R-1 and R-2 occupancres In Group R1

- and R-2 occupangcies, sprinklers shall be installed in bathrooms, closet areas containing - =
- any electrical or mechanical equipment, foyers, and attached garages, accessibie areas. . = -
‘under interior stairs or landings, exterior balconies and covered patios or landings which |~

 have habitable space directly above the balconies, patio or porch. in living spaces,
- sprinklers shall be the concealed type. For the purpose of inspection, testing, or
maintenance, there shall be provided, at the time of construction, an exierior access -
- door on the side of the building next to the fire sprinkler riser of adequate size io allow

. for valves and gauges to be accessed, repaired and viewed from the exterior for testing -
. and maintenance purposes. The d:mensnons of the access door will be dependent upon-

e the design of the riser and sys’tem devices but shall, in no case, require that servrce-_:j RN

Ordmance#O?OB o : IRt I
o Juhe7,2007 0 e S



_"_-'.personnel must enter a prlvate dwelhng or garage to reach the nser for serwce and/or.-___-
-repazr - S R : . .

:_':.Sectron 903 2 7 5 IS added to read as follows

_' 903275 Specral requ:rements for Group R-4 occupancres R 4 occupanmes .-
- sprinklers shall be installed in bathrooms, closet areas containing any electrical or . .

. mechanical equipment, foyers, attached garages, and accessible areas. under interior . S
stairs or landings. State licensed facilities shall be equrpped wrth an approved automatlc e

Co 'sprrnkler system in accordance Wlth this code B

3 Sectlon 903 2. 14 is added to read as follows o

'.2:'903 214 Special - requrrements for - speculatrrre “warehotises: . Specu!atlve:-‘_.-
. warehouses shail comply with this Chapter ‘Chapter 23, and NFPA 13. The minimum~ ;

.- sprinkler -design in 'speculative warehouses shall be based upon a minimum class IV SR
- commodity and maximum allowable storage height in the building. The system shallbe ..

. :"'-_-__j_hydrauhcally designed to protect the maximum possible clear height of storage without -

.. in-rack sprinklers and/or use an approved alternate de3|gn such as Early Suppressuon_
- .. Fast Response (ESFR) sprinklers. -~ " e
IR Sectron 903.3.7 the followulq is herebv added to sectlon 903 3 7 as follows

'All S|gnage to be consistent with the requrrements in the "Surprrse Frre Department SN
Emergency Access Detarls“ book : . R TR :

e -Sectlon 903 3.7. 1 is herebv added to read as follows

L '.903 3.7. 1 Flre department connectlon (FDC) prpmg When a bunldlng or bwldlngs are"" .

~ served by a single or mult:ple Fire Department Connections; the piping shall be . '__' P
arranged so that use of any Flre Department Connectlon wrll supply the entrre burldlng oo

. 'or bu:ldlngs

o | B :if _Sectron 903 3 8 |s herebv added {0 read as follows

o 903.3.8 Flre department connectlon (FDC) strobe. Where an FDC is located on the" |
building a listed exterior horn/strobe device shall be provided above the FDC. if a

e - remote FDC is approved a listed electronic horn strobe shall be installed as part of the o

~ fire department connection. Wiring for either strobe shall be connected to the alarm -

L panetl and shall activate upon spsinkler system flow. All signage shall be consistent with -

the requiremenits in the *Surprise Fire Depariment Emergency Access Details” book. .~

~ Section 903.4.1, delete Excepfion #2 and replace with the following language: -

- _Backflow prev_ention device shutoff vaives, located in the Iirnite_d area_'sprinkler system L
supply piping, shall be locked in the open position. In occupancies required to be

- equipped with a fire alarm system, the backflow prevention valves shall be electrically .

Ordinance #07-08. o S S

7 Jwe7,2007



_ .I'.__._superwsed by a tamper swrtch mstailed in acccrdance wrth NFPA 72 2002 Edltrcn and' -
'_separately annunciated ' T P - :

L Sectlon 903 7 IS added to read as follows

"'-"_903 7 Addltions, a!teratrons or repalrs The prcvrsmns ot thts sectlon are mtended tc-'_' Lo

- provide a reasonable degree of safety for building additions, alterations, or repairs by

requiring installation of an approved automatic sprinkler system. For purposes of the . T

. - :'__"_fotlowmg automatic sprinkier system installation requirements, square footage and area*'_-_;- L
' " calculations shall be calculated by adding together the tctal square tcctage and/cr area B

| u affected by all buuldlng permrts rssuect tcr a structure

An approved autcmatlc spnnkter system sha!l be msta!led throughout the entrre_ "

' structure or building, including all areas and all levels of all Group A, B EFHLMR- L

B 1 R2, R-4 and S cccupancres when any one cf the fcllowmg apply

U 1 Burldlng occupant Icad is lncreased wrthout rncreasmg square footage SR
‘2. Occupancy classification is changed to a hlgher hazard ieve] .
Structure fire resistance rating is decreased. I REENER
‘Work affects more than fifty percent (50%; of the exlstrng buﬂdlng ﬂocr area.

w PO

' percent (50%)

.__-._.'..Note SRR . I I g
Occupancres as detrned in thls Ccde and the C|ty of Surprrse adcpted Buriding Code

" This Section is not intended to. indicate all instances or circumstances where fire o

. Building addltrcn mcreases the emstlng bw!dlng ﬂccr area by mcre than trfty N "

o sprinkler systems are ‘required; refer to. thls Ccde and the City cf Surpnse adcpted'-_' L

_Buﬂdlng Ccde fcr other reqwrements R

| Sectlon 906 1 delete Excep_lon

- Secttcn 906 2, delete Exceptton

o ‘Sectron 907 2 delete and rep_ce wrth the fo!lcwmg language

_ 907 2 Where requ:red -new burldmgs and structures AI! commermal cccupanmes fcr '-'_
~ which a building or construction permit is obtained shall be protected by a fully -
automatic fire alarm system. Installation of the fire alarm system shall be in accordance.

with the requirements of NFPA 72, 2002 Edition, unless otherwise approved by the Fire e
Chief. All fire alarms systems shail be addressable systems with Class-A wiring. o

 Addressable devices in tenant spaces shall include tenant address or suite number.
. An approved fully automatic fire detection system shall be installed in accordance with -

- the provisions of this code and NFPA 72, 2002 Edition,. Devices, combinations of
devices, appliances and equipment shall comply with Section 207.1.2. The automatic

fire detectors shall be smoke detectors, except that an approved alternative type of = .
o '.'detectcr shall be lnstalled in spaces such as bcller rooms, utrirtles rooms, bathrccms_: SRR

Ordmance #07-08 . ) .- o . 72‘_

Y June7, 2007 - -



. 'and Jamtors closet with water heater andjor smk where durmg normal operatlon SR
o products of combustlon are present in suftrment quantlty ’ro actuate a smoke detector -

- "sectron 907 2 2 is herebv added to read as follows

o '90722 ADA ‘horns and strobes ADA homs ‘and strobes shall be lnstalted ln.'--"_
; _accordance wrth thelrlrstrng, and as approved by the Frre Chlef ol

e Sectron 907 4 1 delete and _place w:th the followmg language

"'Unless otherwrse reqwred by the Fire. Chlef ‘manual flre alarm boxes shall not be. -

- installed in occupancies where the building is equipped throughout with an approvedf"- . N
. automatlc sprrnkler system the notlﬁcatlon appllances erI actwate on spnnkler water.::-".‘ o

flow

N Exceptlon One manual pull statlon shall be added at the FACP

-.Sectlon 907 15 delete and rej_)lace wrth the followmg Ianguage

907 15 Momtormg Al supervrsed f:re alarm systems and fire protectlon systems shall"-'

" be monitored by a listed full service Central Station, providing all services in accordance SRR

S with NFPA 72-8.2.2, 2002 Edition. Third parly testing shall be required per NFPA 72- .
7 8.2.4, 2002 Edition, ‘and documentation shall be provrded to the flre department ;n a'_ S

T format acceptable to the Flre Chlef

o '_Sectlon 912 2 1is herebv amended wuth the followmq addttron

'912 2.1 VlStble Iocatron The FDC shall be located on the main entrance srde of the-’ _'

building or in a location approved by the Fire Chief. In addition a horn strobe shall be - e

installed above the FDC in accordance with Section 903.3.8 of this document and the -
'requrrements in the “Surprtse F:re Department Emergency Access Detarls" book ' '

o Sect:lon 912 A, delete and replace wrth the followmg Ianguage. =

_ - 912.4 Slgns A metal sign wrth raised letters at Ieast 1 |nch (25 mm) in size shall be._ -
 mounted on ali Fire Depariment Connections serving fire sprinklers or fire pump. .-

| connections. -Such signs shall read: AUTOMATIC SPRINKLERS or STANDPIPES or. -
- TEST CONNECTION or a combination thereof as applicable. All signage to be

-, consistent with the requrrements in the "Surpnse Flre Department Emergency Access' R
L Deta:ls“ book : : . '

- _._._When a burlding is served by muitlple Ftre Department Connectlons each connectton b
- shall be provided with an approved sign detallrng the area of the burldtng served by S
each connectron . . . _ . .

o Sectlon 912.5, delete and replace wrth the followmg language

. Ordinance #07-08 . : . _73.
" June 7, 2007 S = _ .



| Backﬂow Preventlon The potable water supply shall be protected agalnst backﬂow R

.. Backflow prevention assemblies are allowed to be installed as a portion of the . -

= ' automatic sprinkier system riser inside the building. Backflow prevention assembhes

e shall be U.L. 1469 Listed. Backilow preventlon assembi:es shall be msta!led in an T

o 'onentation in accordance wrth lts listlng

- '_ If an Ex’rerior backﬂow preventron assembly is :nstalled in addttlon to the backﬂow

assemblies on the sprinkler riser system, shutoff vaives shall be locked in the open S
~ position. Backflow prevention device valves shall be electrically supervised by a tamper ST

switch installed in accordance with NFPA 72. On all exterior backflow preventers a.,

o * means shall be provided to accommodate measured forward fiow testing of the

- backflow prevention device at the sprinkler system demand. It shall be the responsrblilty

- of the property owner to comply with state and local jurlsdlc’uonal laws regarding testrng C
. of the backflow preventers. Forward flow test piping shall be sized the same as the ./ :

~ backflow prevention assembly. Piping shall terminate fo the building exterior and the

" terminal connection shall be a test header with a 2% inch national standard thread
- outlet for each 250 galions of system demand. A metal sngn with raised letters at Ieast 1
“ inch in size shall be mounted on all test headers. Such signs shali read: TEST i
. CONNECTION or an ‘approved alternative as applicable. Required water suppIy shaII S

" notbe interrupted, for any reason, without prior approval of the, fure chlef

Sectlon 907 2.24 IS hereby added to read as foilows

e -':_’_'_"Chapter 10, MEANS OF EGRESS

"iff_:_”Sectron 1008 1 2 rewse exceptlon #3 to read as foliows

"Dcors wuthln or serv:ng a s:ngle dwelhng unlt m Groups R2 R3 and R4 as‘*
: _'_'_ﬁapphcable (no other changes) . . S L

| Sectmn 1008 1 8 6, delete exceptlon #3 and replace w:th the followmq Ianguage

a The door Iocks shall have ihe capaballty of berng unlocked by a s:gnal from the frre '- .'

command center, except R-4 Condltlon 2 occupancues

Sectton 1008 1 -9, delete and replace wnth the followmg Ianguage

1008.1.9 Panic and fire exit hardware Where pamc and flre exnt hardware is mstalled B =

it shall comply w1th the followmg

The actua’ung pomon of the re!easmg devnce shall extend at ieas’r one-haif of the door'

© . leaf width.

The maxumum unIatchlng force shall not exceed 15 pounds (67 N)

Each door in a means of egress from a Group A or £ occupancy, havung an occupant'

" load of 50 or more, and any Group H occupancy shali not be provrded wrth a latch or . .

!ock unless lt is panic hardware or frre exlt hardware. |

__Ordinance#O?(}a__'_. : ':' 74
Jurne 7, 2007 - L . _



- ln other than R- 3 and R 4 occupancues (no other changes)

K balanced doors are used and panlc hardware is requ:red the panlc hardware shall be. a2
- the push-pad type and the pad shall not extend more than one-half the Wldth of the__ TR
door measured from the Iatch sude AR S . Do

Sectron 1025 2 rewse exceptlons #1 and #2 to read

In other than R 3 and R 4 occupanmes (no other changes) -

-r':"_'-'_"cnapter 14 FIRE SAFETY DURING cousmucnom AND DEMOLITION

5 a Sectlon 1410 3is hereby added and shaII read as follows DR

PR 1410 3 Access road SIgns Durlng constructaon approved s:gns shall be located to

| ___'_dlrect emergency responders lnto and through the constructlon sﬁe

f_-_’?'i_-_'_'_'Chapter 22 MOTOR FUEL-DISPENS!NG FACILIT!ES AND REPAIR GARAGES

R | Sectlon 2208 3 2 |s herebg dded to read as follows

. 2208, 3 2 Vehlcle lmpact protectlon Vehrcle |mpact protectlon for CNG gas storage'j ..;
_ containers, pumps and dispensers’ shall be ‘provided in accordance with, Sect:on'.'f:-': RS
o _-2206 4. In other than R 3 and R 4 occupancres (no other changes) L '

:'Chapter 26, WELDlNG AND OTHER HOT WORK

R Sectlon 2604 2. 6., delete and reglace wsth the fo!lowmg Ianguaqe

o 2604 2. 6 Flre extmgulsher A mlnlmum of one portable frre extmgursher complylng o
- with Section 906 and with a minimum 2-A:20-B:C rating; shalil be readily accessible =

- within 30 feet (9144 mm)} of the location where hot work is performed and shall be a

o accessrble without climbing stalrs or ladders : : : ERE :

o Sectlon 2604 2.6.1 is herebv added to read as follows

" ":-'-'_2604261 Fire Extmgwsher O_mlssmn Flre extrngwshers may be omltted as.' )

_ ‘approved by the Fire Chief.
- Chapter 33, EXPLOSIVES AND FIREWORKS

- | Sectlon 3308. 11, delete and replace mth the followmg Ianguage -

| _" _3308 11 Retail dlsplay and sale It rs unlawful 1o sell use- or possess for use
consumerflreworks - : _ _

" Ordinance #07-08 " ST S

- June7,2007



3308 12 Flrework Dlsplay Fll’eWOl‘kS may only be possessed by a person havmg a_
valid shooters permit issued by the Fire Chief or any other Arlzona flre department
Prlor to entenng Clty Ilmlts frreworks shaII be pre-squnbbed T

- 1. The fire mspector and shooter or agent shall conduct a pre srte :nspectlon

- 2. All barriers, fencing and safety measures shall be in place :
3. The fire inspector will provide security for the display sﬂe

4, Others will not be allowed into the display proximity. - - ' : .

5. -The fire inspector and shooter will inspect the display s snte aﬂerthe shoot S e
-, 8. Protective clothing shall be worn by aII personnel znsrde the display proxrmuty?-- e
- during the shoot. IR
7. Discharge of shell shall be strarght (verhcal) mto the sky Shells shal] not be Set (R

less than 90 degrees vertical unless packaged that way from the manufacturer. -

o __:_'___'-'and NFPA 1123, NFPA 1124 and NFPA 1126 2002 Edltlon B

o :_'Chapter 34, FLAMMABLE AND COMBUSTIBLE LIQUIDS S
S s Sectron 3404. 2 9.5.1, delete and replace wrth the foIIowmg language

3404 2. 9 5. 1 Locatlons where aboveground tanks are proh;brted Storage of Class"'.-'_. -'
1 and |l liquids in aboveground tanks outside of bu:ldmgs IS prohlblted wﬁhrn the Ilmlts el

) £ __as established by the Clty of Surprsse Fire Department

_Chapter 38, LIQUEFIED PETROLEUM GAS (LP)

PR " Sect:on 3803 2. 1 7. delete and replace wnth the followmg Iang@ge_

:3803 2. 1 7 Use for food preparatmn Llsted and approved LP gas commercnal food-l”"

" “service appliances shall be permitted to be used inside restaurants and in commercial

. food catering operations that are attended. No ‘commercial food service appllances_'__

- shall have more than two 10-0z non- reflllable gas containers with a maximum water

.. capacity of 1.08 Ib. per container connected directly to the appliance at any time; '

- Containers shall not be manifolded. The appliance fuel oontalner(s) shall be an integral: .
- part of the listed, approved commercral food semoe dewce and shall be oonnected R
E .'.--_-thhoutthe use ofa hose o . S ] : o

'_ ._LPG contalners shall be Ilsted Storage in restaurants and at food semce Iocatlons of-' o
10-0z LPG non-reflllable oontalners shall be Ilmlted to no. more than twenty—four. -

contamers

" Ordinance#0708 - - - .. 76
Cdune7,2007 . T oo

- 8. All other safety measures shall be followed for fireworks in the IFC Chapter 33'-:



PASSED AND ADOPTED by the Clty Councd of the Clty of Surprlse Arizona th|s'. oo . o

28 day of -~ June 2007

.J'H. Sh_a_fer M_ay_or_ e

Yeas Mavor Shafer V:ce Mavor Suﬂwan Counc:i Members Baiis Foro and |
_— Johnson Absent Arlsmendez (1 vacancy Dlstnct 1) ' L

. Ordinance #0708 - .. .- . .77
Y June7,2007 o . ai e

. APPROVEDASTOFORM: ~ =~ .. .

. Baley, City Attprey.



. ORDINANCE #07-08
~ AN ORDINANCE OF THE MAYOR AND COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF
 SURPRISE, ARIZONA, AMENDING CHAPTER 15.04 OF THE .
 SURPRISE MUNICIPAL CODE, AND IN ORDER TO ADOPT THE
INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE 2006, INTERNATIONAL FIRE
'~ CODE 2006, INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE 2006, -
INTERNATIONAL MECHANICAL CODE 2006, INTERNATIONAL
. PLUMBING CODE 2006, INTERNATIONAL FUEL GAS CODE 2006,
INTERNATIONAL ELECTRIC CODE 2008, INTERNATIONAL ENERGY
-~ CONSERVATION CODE 2006, INTERNATIONAL EXISTING -
BUILDINGS CODE 2006, INTERNATIONAL PROPERTY

'MAINTENANCE CODE 2006, AND THE AMENDMENTS USED TO |
: REGULATE CONSTRUCTION WITHIN THE CITY.

A copy of this ordinance is available at the City Clerk’s Office

PASSED AND ADOPTED by the Clty Council of the Clty of Surprlse Arlzona thls
28 L dayof _ June . 2007 L

o d H. Shafer, Mayor

ATTEST: . .. . - APPROVEDASTOFORM:

\Am /)M

Sher gu;!ar Clty e

=

. B ‘l'eSﬁ _jCity. Attprney

Yeas !Vlavor Shafer V:ce Mavor Sulhvan Councﬂ Members Balls Foro and
Johnson Absent Ansmendez (1 vacancy Dlstnct‘l) :

Nays




' A&@&m o . __ J 2;1’55“002!3:;;&3?
SURPRISE P _

4
;
r
. _"f_‘P__. _d_'__"‘_'_._”'_;-j .
CRRITON Y

SURPRISE CITY ATTORNEY
REQUEST FOR LEGAL SERVICES

Pfease retam form Mth documeni thmughout the entire process e

'ConiactPsrson o '. _ForrestFre]dar .
' Ext,&Dapartment: o B 4314 Commumty Deve[o;:ment .' :

'_le!ract Tﬂe. _' o - S _ Ordlrlam:e 07-08 2006 intamatronal B.uidmg Codes

. DawofContract, - . . - ___"07101;2007 =

T E"’.entfPerfPﬂ"ﬁnce: a IR j o _ . . Ll
; Dest.‘.r!pﬁon'cf Legal - o : __Re‘qnesﬁng Legal Raviaw'éf'crdihajiﬁ"céO?;-Da, which .améhd_s': - _

. Services Requested: w0 e Ghapter 15.04 of the Surprise Municipal Code, In order to adopt the. .
IRV o e, s 2008 Infermational Bwldmg Codes (IBC IRC !MC IPC IFGC fEC,
P _ -____IECC IEBCIPMC) R
Vendor Name, I SRR v

R Address,&?hona. o - S
) .--.__'g.fknown) ) _ .
" ve coimcél?' R . _ Yes, 03/08/2007.. '_
I Yes, besting Date: S T

- Julie, Forresz vill be out of the c:ft'ce February 5 16 I you have e.ny quasﬂans dunng thls tfmeframe cali B
"Mary Casagrande @ Ext, 4289. A!sm the Fre Codss were senl under separate Gover by the Fire
Department for Lega! rewew S : . : - . o

wCity Attorney’s Office Use®

Approvad.

QYYDU@ Q&d .. . " L

GrtyAttOHeysoﬁice . e - Date -

Gomments: '

' . IDate _5;_/57/} i . 3 ”Eletumed to:




A

_' ».gg.,m . CITY OF SURPRISE '
SHRPRfSE S __Main_Ag_enda-_ )

uuow‘-

© me2s, 2007 @ 6: oo 00 M

ﬁ + Back H_E_’; Prmt

Council Meeti'ng 'D.;ate:"' 'Jun'e 28,200'? Contact  Scott Chesney, (ommumty
ST Person .-: Development SR

Submittirig ' o _Clty Clerk Dlstrlct ' CltyWIde

Department: © . - S

' Staff e Approve o

_ Recomme_ndations: o

* Consent’ X o Regular PUblmHeanng _ Reporthlscussmn AR

- Con31derat10n and actxon on Ordmance No 07 08 amendmg Chapter 15 04 of the Surpnse 5
" Municipal Code, and in order to adopt the International Building Code 2006, Intetnational Fire
Code 2006, International Residential Code 2006, International Mechanical Code 2006, '. e
- International Plumbing Code 2606, International Fuel Gas Code 2006, International Electric ~ *
‘Code 2006, International Energy Conservation Code 2006, Intemat;onal Existing Buildings Code.
- 2006, International Property Maintenance Code 2006, and the amenclments used to regulate

- constructlon within the city - (F inal Readlng)

. Imove to approve the final readiglg of _Ord"inanee_No. '07-08'. -

Backgrou'nd': -

Financial Impact Statement:

ATTACHMENTS:
~ Click to dowuload

o I:IOrdananea _'




" Meeting Requirements: - ST
Powepoint x Video © WhiBoad  Other x

" Presentation Speaker Names (spelfing and titles for TV caj tions): -
Scott Chesney, Community Development Director

 CouncitAction: . Results:
.- Motion/Second - T

- Shafer. . v For B
Elkins ' - T Against’ - - o o
.Bails : o
Sulivan =~ .. _.. .- - Failed
Arismendez . _.. .. . - .Continue. -
- Johnson ' ... Tabled - . __ Ce s )
- Foro -~ . . Absent 1 -{Arismendez) -

o : . -Vacancy . 1___{District1) . -

.g'

m.

©Passed . X _FinalReading -



